
  

 
 
 
 
 

October 2, 2014 

 

TO:  Hamblen County Legislative Body 

 

FROM: Cindy Dibb 

  Office of the Hamblen County Mayor 

 

RE:  October Committee Meeting Information 

 

 

 

Monday, October 6, 2014 at 11:30 a.m. – Hamblen County Health Department Conference Room 

 

 

 

 Solid Waste Board Member Vote 
 

 

 Finance Committee – Immediately following Solid Waste Board Member Vote 

 

 

 Public Services Committee – Immediately following Finance Committee 

 

 

 Jail Study Committee – Immediately following Public Services Committee 

 

 

 Calendar and Rules Committee – Immediately following Buildings and Grounds Committee 
 

 

 

“The People’s House” 

511 West Second North Street Morristown, Tennessee  37814 
Office: 423-586-1931 
Fax: 423-585-4699 

Email cdibb@co.hamblen.tn.us 
  

Bill Brittain 

County Mayor 

HAMBLEN COUNTY 

 GOVERNMENT 
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Hamblen County Legislative Body 
2014/2015 Solid Waste Board Members 

 Vote Ballot 
 

Sign and date: 
Commissioner ______________________________________     Date:_______________ 

 

 

 Vote for three (3) 

 

 The three (3) nominees who receive the most 

votes will be presented to the full Commission 

for official appointment at the October 16, 

2014 commission meeting. 

 

 The terms of the board members will be 

staggered.  The nominee who receives the 

most votes would serve a three (3) year term.  

The nominee who receives the second most 

votes would serve a two (2) year term.  The 

nominee who receives the third most votes 

would serve a one (1) year term. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Paul Baldy  

 

Mickey Beesley  

 

Bill Blackburn  

 

Doug Deering  

 

Matt Lacy  

 

Wayne Pigmon  

 

Tom Rush  

 

FOR VOTE FOR THREE (3) 
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   Hamblen County Government 

  FINANCE COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, October 6, 2014 

Immediately Following Solid Waste Board Member Vote 

Hamblen County Health Department – Conference Room 

 

AGENDA 
 

1. Call to Order – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

 

 

2. Visitors Wishing to Address the Committee – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

(Visitors will be allotted 5 minutes to speak) 

 

 

3. Recurring Business – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. Operating Summaries – September 2014 (Information Only)  

b. Review of Monthly Checks Submitted by the County Mayor’s Office 

 

 

4. Old Business – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. None 

 

 

5. New Business – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. Bid/Garbage Can – Finance Director Joey Barnard 

b. Application FY14 Homeland Security Grant – Finance Director Joey 

Barnard 

 

 

6. Items of Interest (No Action Necessary) – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. Planning Commission Building Permit Report - September 2014 

b. County Attorney Invoices – September 2014 

c. Coroner’s Monthly Report – September 2014  

 

7. Adjournment – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Finance Committee 

Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

Chairman 

 

Herbert Harville 

Vice-Chairman 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Larry Carter 

Member 

 

Hubert Davis 

Member 

 

Randy DeBord 

Member 

 

Howard Shipley 

Member 

 

John Smyth 

Member 

 

Dana Wampler 

Member 
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9/29/2014 kdr 

Hamblen County, Tennessee 
Invitation to Bid – New, Mobile 95 Gallon Refuse Carts 
 

Bid Tabulation 
 

 
 

  
 
Otto Environmental 

   
 
Rehrig Pacific Company 

   
 
Toter, LLC 

   
Municipal 
Equipment, Inc. 

Amount per cart $ 50.52/each  $ 56.80  $ NO BID  $ NO BID 
Cart Model  Otto, MSD-95M, 2014   Rehrig Pacific, ROC-95U, 2014       

EXCEPTIONS TAKEN?  None   Yes       
Vendor Location  Charlotte, NC   Lawrenceville, GA       

Estimated Delivery Time  60 calendar days   30-45 calendar days       
Notes?  None   Price firm for 90 days       

Total $ 50.52/each  $ 56.80/each  $ NO BID  $ NO BID 
 

Apparent Low Bidder:  Otto Environmental 
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MEMORANDUM 
 

 

 

TO:  Joey Barnard, Finance Director 

FROM: Chris Bell 

DATE: 24 September 2014 

RE:  FY14 Homeland Security Grant 

CC:  All Commissioners 

 

 
In September 2014, my office received a copy of the executed contract for the FY14 

Homeland Security Grant through the Office of Domestic Preparedness. This grant, like those 

in the past, is a federally funded, 100% grant with no match required. This grant is in the 

amount of $16,000. 

 

In accordance with the grant contract, my office intends to comply with the terms and 

limitations of the Initial Strategy Implementation Plan (ISIP) that I previously submitted to 

the State. This ISIP was agreed upon following a decision of the Homeland Security District 

II Council. 

 

The scope of this grant will provide necessary equipment / upgrades for the various 

Emergency Departments. 

 

All agencies / departments that will be receiving equipment purchased from this grant have 

submitted documentation stating their compliance with the National Incident Management 

System (NIMS), which is a requirement for receipt of homeland security grant funding.  

 

I respectfully request that approval be given to fill out the application for the FY14 Grant. 

 

As always, I will be available to answer any questions that you or the other Commissioners 

may have. 

 

Thank you. 

Morristown-Hamblen Emergency Management Agency 

Hamblen County Courthouse 

511 West Second North Street 

Morristown, Tennessee 37814 

(423) 581-6225 

cbell@co.hamblen.tn.us  
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Sept 2014

Permit Date Applicant Type Address Construction Permit SW Plumbing Mech. Gas Total Tax Map Group Parcel

14-151 9/2/14 Crum Carport 1458 Moyers Lane 37814 $2,200.00 $25.00 $25.00 040A A 010.00

14-152 9/2/14 McClanahan Storage Bldg 2876 Coffey Road 37813 $300.00 $40.00 $40.00 049 037.05

14-153 9/3/14 Butler Storage Bldg 1059 Little Mtn Road 37860 $2,500.00 $72.00 $72.00 027 011.05

14-154 9/3/14 Lovelace Garage 4170 Carnation Drive 37814 $70,000.00 $345.00 $345.00 011I F 027.00

14-155 9/3/14 Feldman Garage 3064 Valley Home Road 37813 $13,000.00 $355.00 $355.00 056 145.01

14-156 9/3/14 Mutter Garage Rosa Circle 37814 $22,000.00 $240.00 $240.00 017M C 010.00

14-157 9/4/14 Verizon Tower 3668 Everett Road 37814 $280,000.00 n/c *paid in April during application process n/c 040 084.00

14-158 9/5/14 Jarnagin Enc. Deck 7500 Lebanon Church Rd 37877 $3,600.00 $65.00 $65.00 046 012.04

14-159 9/10/14 Greene Garage 2515 Robin Circle 37813 $1,000.00 $180.00 $180.00 043J C 023.00

14-160 9/10/14 Nail Porch 4384 Barding Drive 37860 $1,000.00 $25.00 $25.00 044 054.00

14-161 9/9/14 Gilliam House 919 Whitesburg Pike 37891 $65,000.00 $1,228.50 $100.00 $90.00 $15.00 $1,433.50 012 pt of 065.00

14-162 9/12/14 Gunter Garage 1021 Hershey Drive 37891 $500.00 $57.00 $57.00 012K A 003.00

14-163 9/15/14 Fullington Garage 1775 Seven Oaks Drive 37814 $500.00 $96.00 $96.00 039L C 015.00

14-164 9/15/14 Burke House 4234 Willow Way 37814 $120,000.00 $785.40 $100.00 $95.00 $15.00 $995.40 040F D 037.00

14-166 9/18/14 Amos Storage Bldg 3004 Valley Home Road 37813 $9,500.00 $64.00 $64.00 056 151.00

14-167 9/18/14 Coffey Modular House 1083 Mullins Road 37891 $160,000.00 $411.75 $100.00 $511.75 012 029.06

14-168 9/19/14 Brewer Addition 6611 Old Russellville Pike 37860 $25,000.00 $144.00 $35.00 $179.00 019 026.00

14-169 9/22/14 Frazine Storage Bldg 6001 Old Russellville Pike 37860 $500.00 $80.00 $80.00 019I 011.00

14-170 9/25/14 Sergent House 3427 Red Drive 37814 $108,000.00 $977.50 $100.00 $100.00 $15.00 $25.00 $1,217.50 017K E 008.00

14-171 9/26/14 Hurley DWMH 6506 Old Russellville Pike 37860 $15,000.00 $350.00 $350.00 019 015.00

Total 20 Total: $899,600.00 $5,541.15 $400.00 $320.00 $45.00 $25.00 $6,331.15

Running Total 66 $3,135,519.00 $18,572.60 $1,100.00 $1,240.00 $175.00 $110.00 $21,103.10

ETHRA Monthly YTD

Total No. Amount Total HOMES 0 0

Copies and Miscellaneous $0.00 $0.00 September

Re-Zoning Request $75.00 $0.00 Grand 

Variance Request 1 $50.00 $50.00 Total: $7,181.15

Plat Approval 5 $150.00 $750.00

3 lots or more Land Disturbance/Development $100.00 $0.00 2014-2015

Use on Review 1 $50.00 $50.00  Running

Refunds $0.00

Total Collected . $850.00 Total: $22,803.10

Running Total Collected $1,700.00
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Hamblen County Government 

PUBLIC SERVICES COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, October 6, 2014 

Immediately Following Adjournment of Finance Committee 

Hamblen County Health Department, Conference Room 

 

AGENDA 

 

1. Call to Order – Chairman Herbert Harville 

 

2. Visitors Wishing to Address the Committee – Chairman Herbert Harville 

(Visitors will be allotted 5 minutes to speak) 

 

  

3. Old Business – Chairman Herbert Harville 

a. Morristown-Hamblen Humane Society Contract – County Mayor Bill Brittain 

 

 

4. New Business – Chairman Herbert Harville 

a. None 

 

 

5. Items of Interest (No Action Necessary) – Chairman Herbert Harville 

a. Charter Communications – HD Channel Line-up 

                                          

                                                                                                                                                                 

6. Adjournment – Chairman Herbert Harville 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 
Public Services  

Committee 

 
Herbert Harville 

Chairman 

 
Rick Eldridge 

Vice-Chairman 

 
Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 
Larry Carter 

Member 

 
Hubert Davis 

Member 

 
Randy DeBord 

Member 

 
Joe Huntsman, Sr. 

Member 

 
Howard Shipley 

Member 

 
John Smyth 

Member 
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         Bacon, Jessee & Perkins 

         Attorneys at Law 
         1135 West Third North Street 

         Morristown, TN 3781 

 

 

AGREEMENT 
 

 THIS AGREEMENT is made this ______ day of __________________, 2014 by and 

among CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TENNESSEE, a municipal corporation, created by the 

Private Acts of the Tennessee Legislature for 1903, Chapter 103 (“CITY”); HAMBLEN 

COUNTY, TENNESSEE, a political subdivision of the State of Tennessee (“COUNTY”); and 

MORRISTOWN-HAMBLEN HUMANE SOCIETY, a non-profit agency created by Charter on 

July 19, 1972 (“MHHS”), which is operated by a board of directors  (“BOARD”).   

WHEREAS 
1. MHHS has previously contracted with City to provide City with enforcement of 

animal control ordinances, operate the city pound as the Morristown-Hamblen 

Animal Shelter, conduct cruelty investigations, present annual budget requests to the 

City and County, and employ a humane officer and other necessary shelter personnel 

with volunteers assisting in the day-to-day operations, and 

2. The City provides funding to MHHS for its operating expenses.  The amount funded 

to MHHS for the 2014-2015 fiscal year is one-hundred and thirty-seven thousand 

eight-hundred and ninety dollars ($137,890.00), and 

3. The County provides funds to MHHS for its operating expenses.  The amount funded 

to MHHS for the 2014-2015 fiscal year is one-hundred and thirty-three thousand five-

hundred dollars ($133,500.00), and 

4. Pursuant to Tennessee Code Annotated §5-1-120 and County Resolution, the County 

has the authority to license and regulate dogs and cats, establish and operate shelters 

and other animal control facilities, and regulate, capture, impound and dispose of 

stray dogs, stray cats and other stray animals, and 

5. The City and County intend to contract with MHHS for a period of beginning 

November 1, 2014 and ending at midnight June 30, 2015, for the continuation of 

animal control, shelter services, and the operations of the MHHS. 

 

TERMS AND CONDITIONS   
 IT IS THEREFORE AGREED BY AND AMONG THE PARTIES THAT: 

(a) Board.  During the term of this Contract, including extensions and renewals 

thereof, the Board shall consist of fourteen (14) members, eight of whom shall be 

selected by MHHS; and the City Mayor, or his designee; the County Mayor, or his 

designee; a Hamblen County citizen who may reside in the city, appointed by the 

City Mayor; a Hamblen County citizen who may reside in the City, appointed by 

the County Mayor; a Hamblen County veterinarian who may reside in the City, 

appointed by the City and County Mayors; and a citizen appointed by the City 

Council who may not be an employee or officer of the City or County.  If there 

should be a conflict between the MHHS by-laws and this provision, MHHS shall 

amend its by-laws to conform with this agreement. 
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(b) Tax exempt status.  MHHS shall maintain a 501(c)(3) tax exempt status with the 

Internal Revenue Service. 

 

(c) Budget and Financial reports. During the term hereof and any renewal term, 

MHHS shall submit to the Mayors’ offices as part of the governments’ annual budget 

process, a proposed budget for the subsequent fiscal year along with its appropriation 

requests.  During each fiscal year, MHHS shall submit monthly financial reports to 

the Mayors’ offices by the 15
th

 day of the subsequent month beginning with the year-

end report for the 2013-14 fiscal year.  

 

(d) Accounting reports. During the term of this Contract, including extensions and 

renewals thereof, MHHS shall conduct a separate accounting report of funds 

received for fines, adoption fees, rescue reimbursements/operations, building 

donations, and all other funds. 

 

(e) Audit.  MHHS shall have a financial audit completed for the 2013-2014 fiscal year 

and shall submit said audit report to the Mayors’ offices. 

 

(f) Disposition of animals.  MHHS shall submit to the Mayors monthly reports of 

shelter activity that includes, but is not limited to, the number of animals that have 

entered the shelter, along with the disposition of cases involving all animals 

handled by the animal shelter personnel. 

 

(g) Management reports.  MHHS shall submit to the Mayors quarterly reports 

including: (i) management decisions made to improve operations and 

reduce/maintain costs; (ii) any and all changes of the members of the Board and 

staff/personnel; (iii) any and all activities or decisions that could improve or 

damage the operation of the shelter or animal control operations. 

 

(h) Operations reports.  MHHS shall prepare and submit to the Mayors on a 

semiannual basis updated standard operating procedures, which includes, but is not 

limited to, the process of how staff decides whether to adopt, euthanize, or rescue 

an animal, plus an organizational chart, and the Board membership with officers. 

 

(i) Sunshine law.  During the term of this contract and any extension or renewal 

thereof, MHHS shall comply with the Tennessee Open Meetings and Open 

Records Acts as applicable in all respects. 

 

(j) Minutes of meetings.  MHHS shall submit board minutes to the Mayors within 

two (2) weeks after the meetings. 

 

(k) Insurance.  MHHS shall obtain and maintain all appropriate insurance policies, 

including, but not limited to, workers’ compensation insurance, comprehensive 

liability insurance and officers and directors insurance with coverage’s and 

companies acceptable to the City and County. 
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(l) Oversight.  The City and County shall create an oversight committee to 

periodically review the operations of the animal shelter and animal control to 

insure that all applicable state laws are being followed, and that the organization is 

following sound business practices and meeting the conditions set out in this 

Agreement.  The oversight committee will consist of the County Finance Director, 

the City’s Administrative Services Director, and a representative of the Companion 

Animal Initiative of Tennessee at the UT College of Veterinary Medicine. MHHS 

agrees to give the oversight committee all documents and access to all areas of the 

shelter to evaluate operations. 

 

(m) Termination.  Any party may terminate this contract for cause by providing 

written notice of the cause alleged to entitle the notifying party to terminate the 

contract.  If the alleged cause is not corrected within forty-five (45) days of 

notification, the notifying party may declare default and terminate the contract on a 

date certain which shall not be less than thirty (30) days. During the notice period, 

MHHS agrees to continue providing care for the animals until the notice period 

expires. Thereafter, it shall be the responsibility of the City and County to care for 

the animals and comply with their obligations concerning animal control.  Once the 

notice period expires, MHHS agrees to give the City and County access to the 

premises to care for the animals. In the event of termination, all requirements of 

MHHS to report to the City and/or County, based upon this Contract, shall 

terminate. 

 

(n) Purchase of Assets.   If this contract is not renewed by any party beyond June 30, 

2015, the City and County agree to buy the physical non-cash assets of the animal 

shelter and animal control operations based upon inventory herein after referenced 

for a sum of $30,000. The items include, but are not limited to, all the equipment, 

fixtures, vehicles and supplies used in MHHS’s daily operation.  The MHHS 

maintains the option of keeping its physical assets and moving them to another 

location.  An inventory of the physical assets will be taken within ten (10) days 

following the execution of this agreement. 

 

(o) Operating Funds.  In the event of termination or non-renewal of this agreement, 

the MHHS will not be responsible for refunding any operating funds to the City 

and the County. 

  

(p) Debts of MHHS. In the event of a termination or non-renewal of this agreement, 

the City and County shall not be responsible for any outstanding debts, including 

loans, unpaid payroll or payroll taxes, and accounts payable accumulated through 

the effective date of termination or end of the contract term. 

 

(q)  Companion Animal Initiative. MHHS shall schedule with the Companion 

Animal Initiative of TN (CAIT) at the UT College of Veterinary Medicine an 

assessment of the shelter/animal control operations and exert its best efforts to have 

the assessment completed within sixty (60) days of the execution of the contract.  

The objective of the assessment is to identify strengths and weaknesses of the 
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shelter and animal control operations.  MHHS shall prepare and implement an 

action plan to improve shelter and animal control operations without additional 

government or MHHS funding and submit it to the City and County within sixty 

(60) days of the submission of the CAIT report. 

 

(r) Prior Agreements.  There is an existing agreement between the City and MHHS 

dated July 1, 1999.  That agreement, along with any other prior agreements 

between MHHS and either or both of the remaining parties, are hereby terminated.  

It is the intention of the parties that this agreement shall supersede all prior 

agreements between or among the parties hereto. 

  

(s) Delegation of authority.  MHHS shall, during the term hereof, assume the rights, 

duties and responsibilities as Morristown’s Animal Control Authority, as defined in 

the City’s Animal Control Ordinance. 

 

(t) Fees.  All of the fees paid by animal owners associated with impoundment of their 

animals shall be collected by MHHS and become the sole property of MHHS. 

 

(u) Indemnification.  MHHS shall indemnify and hold the City and County harmless 

from any claims, losses or liability which may arise from the MHHS’s operations 

or acts of its employees, officers and directors.   

 

(v) Term.  Unless earlier terminated pursuant to this agreement, the term shall 

commence as of November 1, 2014, ending at midnight June 30, 2015.  This 

agreement will automatically renew for a period of one (1) year on July 1, 2015 

unless any party notifies the others in writing no less than 60 days prior to the end 

of the term that it does not wish to renew the agreement  

 

(w) Use of facilities.  During the term hereof, MHHS shall be entitled to the use of the 

City’s current shelter facilities on Dice Street and maintain reasonable office hours 

at the shelter for the convenience of the public.    

 

(x) Funding.  During the term hereof funding shall be in monthly installments with the 

City contributing eleven thousand four hundred ninety dollars and eighty-three 

cents  ($11,490.83) per month and the County contributing eleven thousand one 

hundred and twenty five dollars ($11,125.00) per month.  Payments shall be made 

on or before the 15
th

 day of each month. 

 

(y) Independent contractors.  In performing their duties and exercising their rights 

hereunder, the parties shall be deemed to be acting as independent contractors. 

 

(z) Binding parties.  This agreement shall be binding on the parties hereto, their 

successors and assigns.  
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EXECUTED on the day and date first above appearing. 

 

CITY OF MORRISTOWN, TENNESSEE (“CITY”) 

 

By:______________________________________ 

     DANNY THOMAS, MAYOR 

 

HAMBLEN COUNTY, TENNESSEE (“COUNTY”) 

 

By:_______________________________________ 

     BILL BRITTAIN, MAYOR 

 

MORRISTOWN-HAMBLEN HUMANE SOCIETY (“MHHS”) 

 

By:________________________________________ 

     CHRISTINE COLEY, PRESIDENT 
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Hamblen County Government 

JAIL STUDY COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, October 6, 2014 

Immediately Following Adjournment of Public Services Committee  

Hamblen County Health Department Conference Room 

  

AGENDA  

 

1. Call to Order – Chairman Rick Eldridge 

 

 

2. Old Business  - Chairman Rick Eldridge 

a. None 

 

 

3. New Business   - Chairman Rick Eldridge 

a. Report of Jail Tour on September 24, 2014 

b. Discussion of Jail Doors Locking Systems 

 

 

4. Items of Interest – Chairman Rick Eldridge 

a. None 

 

 

5. Adjournment – Chairman Rick Eldridge 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Jail Study Committee 

Rick Eldridge 

Chair 

 

Howard Shipley 

Vice-Chair 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Larry Carter 

Member 

 

Hubert Davis 

Member 

 

Randy DeBord 

Member 

 

Tim Goins 

Member 

 

Herbert Harville 

Member 

 

Joe Huntsman, Sr. 

Member 

 

Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

Member 

 

John Smyth 

Member 

 

Johnny Walker 

Member 

 

Dana Wampler 

Member 

 

Taylor Ward 

Member 
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 Hamblen County Government 

CALENDAR & RULES COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, October 6, 2014 

Immediately Following Adjournment of Jail Study Committee 

Hamblen County Health Department, Conference Room 

 

 

AGENDA 

 

 

1. Call to Order – Chairman John Smyth 

 

2. Review of Regular Calendar Items – Chairman John Smyth 

 

3. Review of Consent Calendar Items – Chairman John Smyth 

 

4. Adjournment – Chairman John Smyth 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

Calendar & Rules 

Committee 

 

John F. Smyth 

Chairman 

 

Dana Wampler 

Vice-Chair 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

Member 

 

Herbert Harville 

Member 

 

Howard Shipley 

Member 
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   HAMBLEN COUNTY LEGISLATIVE BODY 
 

 

Regularly Scheduled Monthly Meeting 

Thursday, October 16, 2014 

5 p.m. 
 

 

 

Open Meeting - Sheriff Esco Jarnagin 

 

Call to Order – Chairman Stancil Ford 

 

Prayer – TBD 

 

Pledge of Allegiance – Commissioner John Smyth 

 

Roll Call - County Clerk Linda Wilder 

 

Recognition of Visitors – Chairman Stancil Ford 

a. Nigel Reid – Public Comment (5 Minutes) 

 

 

 

Prepared under the direction of: 

Chairman Stancil Ford 
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Order # Vote Item 

1  Recognition (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
 

 

a. Employee Recognition 
b. Judge Mindy Seals Recognition  
c. Leona Tilson,  Library Board - Proclamation 

 

2  Resolutions (Chairman Stancil Ford)  
  a. None 

 

3  Appointments and Nominations (Chairman Stancil Ford)  
 Vote a. Solid Waste Board Appointments (3) – County Commission 
 Vote b. Solid Waste Board Appointment – Mayor Brittain 

 

4  Public Official Bonds (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
  a. Constable Bonds 

 

5  Calendar and Rules Committee Report (Chairman John Smyth)  
  Vote 

Vote 
a. Approval of Consent Calendar Items 
b. Approval of Regular Calendar Items 

 

6  Approval of Consent Calendar (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
 Vote a. Consent Calendar 

 

7  Finance Committee (Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis) 
 Vote a. Approval of Monthly Checks 
 Vote b. Garbage Can Bid  
 Vote c. Application FY14 Homeland Security Grant Garbage Can Bid  

 

8  Public Services Committee (Chairman Herbert Harville) 
 Vote a. Morristown-Hamblen Humane Society Contract 

 

9  Announcements /Informational Items / Upcoming Meeting Dates (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
 

 
a. November 10, 2014 – Committee Meetings at 11:30 a.m. - Health Dept. Conference Room 
b. November 20, 2014 – County Commission Meeting: at 5 p.m. - Third Floor Large Courtroom 

 

10  Adjournment (Commission Chairman) 

REGULAR CALENDAR 
       Thursday,  October  16,  2014  

              H a m b l e n  C o u n t y  L e g i s l a t i v e  B o d y  

REGULAR CALENDAR –October 16, 2014 
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CONSENT CALENDAR                H a m b l e n  C o u n t y  L e g i s l a t i v e  B o d y               

Order # Item Placed From 

1  Approval of the Previous Month’s Minutes 
a. Hamblen County Commission Meeting – September 11, 2014 
b. Hamblen County Commission Meeting – September 18, 2014 

 

Chairman Stancil Ford 

2  Approval of Notaries County Clerk Linda Wilder 

3  Operating Summaries – September 2014 Finance Committee 

4 County Attorney Invoices – September 2014  Finance Committee 

5 Planning Commission Building Permit Report – September 2014 Finance Committee 

6 Coroner’s Report – September 2014 Finance Committee 

 7 Charter Communications – HD Channel Line-Up Changes Public Services Committee 

Thursday, October 16, 2014 
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