
 

 

 
 
 
  
 
 
 

DATE:  December 4, 2014 

 

TO:  Hamblen County Legislative Body 

 

FROM : Cindy Dibb 

  Office of the Hamblen County Mayor 

 

RE:  December Committee Meeting Information 

_____________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

 

Monday, December 8, 2014 at 11:30 a.m. – Hamblen County Health Department Conference Room 

 

 

 Finance Committee  

 

 

 Public Services Committee – Immediately following Finance Committee 

 

 

 Buildings and Grounds Committee - Immediately following Public Services Committee 

 

 

 Personnel Committee – Immediately following Buildings and Ground Committee 

 

 

 Calendar and Rules Committee – Immediately following Personnel Committee 

1 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Page 1 of 1 

 

   Hamblen County Government 

  FINANCE COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, December 8, 2014 

Hamblen County Health Department – Conference Room 

 

AGENDA 
 

1. Call to Order – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

 

 

2. Visitors Wishing to Address the Committee – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

(Visitors will be allotted 5 minutes to speak) 

 

3. Recurring Business – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. Operating Summaries – November 2014 (Information Only)  

b. Review of Monthly Checks Submitted by the County Mayor’s Office 

 

4. Old Business – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. None 

 

5. New Business – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. Community Development Block Grant Resolution - Mayor Bill Brittain 

b. TDOT - School Safety Grant Resolution - Mayor Bill Brittain 

c. Bids - Detachable In-Car Police Video Cameras Bid – Finance Director Joey 

Barnard 

d. Budget Amendment - Assessor of Property - Reclassification $5,000 – 

Finance Director Joey Barnard 

e. Budget Amendment #2 for Hamblen County Dept. of Education - Budget 

Increase $157.641.51 - Supervisor of Business Traci Antrican 

 

6. Items of Interest (No Action Necessary) – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

a. Planning Commission Building Permit Report – November 2014 

b. County Attorney Invoices – November 2014 

c. Coroner’s Monthly Report – November 2014 

d. Hamblen County Board of Education – First Quarter Expenditure Report 

2014-2015 

e. Comcast – Notification of Price Changes 

f. Helen Ross McNabb 2014 in Review  

 

7. Adjournment – Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

F I N A N C E  C O M M I T T E E  

Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

Chairman 

 

Herbert Harville 

Vice-Chairman 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Larry Carter 

Member 

 

Hubert Davis 

Member 

 

Randy DeBord 

Member 

 

Howard Shipley 

Member 

 

John Smyth 

Member 

 

Dana Wampler 

Member 

2 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



3 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



4 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



5 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



6 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



7 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



8 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



9 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



10 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



11 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



12 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



13 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



14 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



15 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



16 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



17 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



18 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



19 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



20 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



21 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 
     
 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING HAMBLEN COUNTY TO MAKE APPLICATION 

FOR A 2015 COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT  

 

 

WHEREAS, the Community Development Block Grant (CDBG) Program as administered by 

the State of Tennessee offers grants to local jurisdictions to fund sewer and water 

line extensions, sewer and water system upgrades, as well as community 

livability projects, and 

 

WHEREAS,   fire protection is provided to citizens of Hamblen County located outside the 

corporate limits of the City of Morristown via four volunteer fire departments 

(VFD); 

 

WHEREAS,   Hamblen County Government and the VFDs wish to provide the best services 

possible at a reasonable cost for their citizens; 

 

WHEREAS,    Hamblen County Government and VFDs have a long range plan of lowering the 

ISO rating in many areas of the county to help property owners purchase 

affordable homeowners insurance; 

 

WHEREAS,    the purchase of firefighting equipment, like fire trucks, is considered a qualifying 

project for CDBG grant funding, because fire protection is considered one of the 

basic services provided by local governments; 

 

WHEREAS,   the VFDs have agreed the East Hamblen County Volunteer Fire Department 

(EHCVFD) has the greatest need among the four VFDs for a Primary Response 

Fire Engine;  

 

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Hamblen County Legislative Body approves the 

application for a total not to exceed $300,000, of which $240,000 will be CDBG 

grant funds and the remainder will be a local match to purchase a new fire truck 

and other firefighting equipment for the EHCVFD; and 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, the Hamblen County Legislative Body commits to providing 

the necessary matching funds not to exceed $60,000 with the EHCVFD 

committed to paying $10,000 of the match from its annual appropriation from 

county government; 

  

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, Hamblen County has selected East Tennessee Development 

District to assist in preparing the grant application for the proposed project. 

 

 

Duly passed and approved this 18
th
  day of December, 2014 

 

 

 

APPROVED: _________________________ 

 Stancil Ford, Chairman, Hamblen County Legislative Body 

 

 

APPROVED: _________________________ 

 Bill Brittain, County Mayor 

 

 

ATTEST: _________________________ 

 Linda Wilder, County Clerk  
22 Return to Committee 

Cover Page



RESOLUTION TO APPROVE APPLICATION FOR THE TDOT SCHOOL SAFETY GRANT 

 
 
WHEREAS, the Lakeway Area Metropolitan Transportation Planning Organization (LAMTPO) is the 
transportation planning organization for the City of Morristown, Hamblen County, and portions of 
Jefferson County near White Pine, Jefferson City and New Market; 
 
WHEREAS, in 2011, LAMTPO commissioned consulting firm McGill Associates to conduct a school 
safety audit for the school zones within the LAMTPO region;  
 
WHEREAS, McGill Associates issued its audit report that identified safety concerns in the 23 school 
zones within the LAMTPO region; 
 
WHEREAS, the LAMTPO Executive Board approved an application for $260,000 in federal funding 
to implement some of the recommendations included in the audit report; 
 
WHEREAS, the School Safety Grant Project must have a lead agency that is responsible for the 
administration of the grant and the accounting of its funds; 
 
WHEREAS, since 20 of the 23 school zones within the LAMPTO region are within Hamblen County, 
that it makes sense that Hamblen County Government be the lead administrative agency for this 
grant project; 
 
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, the Hamblen County Legislative Body hereby approves the 
application and agrees that Hamblen County can serve in the lead administrative capacity, through 
the County Mayor’s Office, for the LAMTPO School Safety Grant Program which is 100% federally 
funded and requires no local matching funds. 
 
 
Adopted this 18th day of December, 2014. 
 
 
APPROVED: 
 
_____________________________________________________ 
Stancil Ford, Chairman, Hamblen County Legislative Body 
 
 
_____________________________________________________ 
Bill Brittain, Hamblen County Mayor 
 
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________________________________ 
Linda Wilder, Hamblen County Clerk  
 

23 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Hamblen County, Tennessee
Invitation to Bid - Detachable In-Car Police Video Cameras

Exceptions Taken? No Yes No 

Estimated Delivery Time 7+ days 

ITEM BID PRICE ITEM BID PRICE ITEM BID PRICE 
Police Body Worn Camera System - 
Including One (1) Year Warranty Wolfcom 3rd Eye  $          475.00 FirstVu HD  $          795.00 Black Mamba BMP pro $          649.99 

In-Car Camera Mount with Detachable 
Metal Clip Car DVR Kit-C  $            65.00  $            65.00 $              1.00 

Leather Case with Detachable Metal Clip LC1  $            55.00  $            45.00 n/a 

TOTAL $          595.00 TOTAL $          905.00 TOTAL $          650.99 

No Bid From: Precise Digital; COBAN Tech
Bid Received After Public Bid Opening: Eye3Data

28 to 42 calendar days

Wolfcom Enterprises Digital Ally, Inc. Johnson Hicks Marine

12/3/2014; 12:23 PM  kdr24 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



25 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



26 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



27 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



28 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



November 2014

Permit Date Applicant Type Address Construction Permit SW Plumbing Mech. Gas Total Tax Map Group Parcel

14-192 11/4/14 Franklin storage building 5260 Spencer Hale Road 37813 $300.00 $36.00 $36.00 057 140.15

14-193 11/4/14 Cook carport 2852 Boat Launch Road 37814 500.00 25.00 $25.00 017 051.01

14-194 11/4/14 Lowe screened porch 2886 Scenic Lake Circle 37814 10,000.00 96.00 $96.00 011I A 004.00

14-195 11/6/14 Crown Castle cell tower upgrade 706 Statem Gap Road 37813 15,500.00 100.00 $100.00 050 007.11

14-196 11/6/14 Hughes addition 6377 Lavern Circle 37877 22,000.00 438.00 $438.00 054G C 008.00

14-197 11/6/14 Onbey storage building 1455 Cain Mill Road 37860 2,400.00 90.00 $90.00 012 044.00

14-198 11/7/14 Davis metal carport 1509 Elgin Drive 37814 1,000.00 25.00 $25.00 025E A 007.00

14-199 11/10/14 Hunter house 552 Fox Drive 37814 40,000.00 648.00 100.00 70.00 15.00 $833.00 048A B 022.03

14-200 11/10/14 Hyslop garage 4654 Fowler Drive 37814 35,000.00 210.00 $210.00 010L A 086.00

14-201 11/14/14 Hyslop garage 4654 Fowler Drive 37814 10,000.00 100.00 $100.00 010L A 086.00

14-202 11/17/14 Lowe deck 2886 Scenic Lake Circle 37814 1,000.00 25.00 $25.00 011I A 004.00

14-203 11/20/14 Nix Pool 7684 Abbey Lane 37877 23,400.00 50.00 $50.00 054A A 015.00

14-204 11/20/14 Grooms SWMH 5153 Bethesda Road 37814 10,000.00 100.00 $100.00 026B B 015.00

14-205 11/20/14 Grooms SWMH 5153 Bethesda Road 37814 10,000.00 100.00 $100.00 018O B 015.00

14-206 11/20/14 EPES commercial bldg 3450 Tornado Trail 37813 75,000.00 1,870.00 $1,870.00 051 026.01

14-207 11/21/14 Christiansen pole barn Gregg Road 37814 9,000.00 192.00 $192.00 032 058.04

14-208 11/25/14 Stephen addition 1070 Little Mountain Road 37860 30,000.00 414.00 $414.00 027 012.01P

$0.00

Total 17 Total: $295,100.00 $4,519.00 $100.00 $70.00 $15.00 $0.00 $4,704.00

Running Total 104 $4,030,457.00 $28,462.40 $1,400.00 $1,535.00 $220.00 $110.00 $31,386.90

ETHRA Monthly YTD

Total No. Amount Total HOMES 0 0

Copies and Miscellaneous $0.00 $0.00 November

Re-Zoning Request $75.00 $0.00 Grand 

Variance Request 1 $50.00 $50.00 Total: $5,354.00

Plat Approval 4 $150.00 $600.00

3 lots or more Land Disturbance/Development $100.00 $0.00 2014-2015

Use on Review $50.00 $0.00  Running

Refunds $0.00

Total Collected $650.00 Total: $35,186.90

Running Total Collected $3,800.0029 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



30 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



31 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



32 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



33 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



34 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



35 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



36 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



37 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



38 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



39 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



40 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



41 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



42 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



43 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



44 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



45 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



46 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



47 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



48 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



49 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



50 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Page 1 of 1 

 

   Hamblen County Government 

  PUBLIC SERVICES COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, December 8, 2014 

Immediately Following Adjournment of Finance Committee 

Hamblen County Health Department – Conference Room 

 

AGENDA 
 

 

1. Call to Order – Chairman Herbert Harville 

 

 

2. Visitors Wishing to Address the Committee – Chairman Herbert Harville 

 (Visitors will be allotted 5 minutes to speak) 

 

 

3. Old Business – Chairman Herbert Harville 

a. None 

 

 

4. New Business – Chairman Herbert Harville 

a. Resolution to Adopt 2012 International and Accessibility Codes – Planning 

Director Danny Young 

 

 

5. Items of Interest (No Action Necessary) – Chairman Herbert Harville 

a. None 

 

 

6. Adjournment – Chairman Herbert Harville 

PUBLIC SE RVI CES 

COMMITTEE  

Herbert Harville 

Chairman 

 

Rick Eldrigde 

Vice-Chairman 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Larry Carter 

Member 

 

Hubert Davis 

Member 

 

Randy DeBord 

Member 

 

Joe Huntsman, Sr. 

Member 

 

Howard Shipley 

Member 

 

John Smyth 

Member 

 

Dana Wampler 

Member 

51 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



MEMORANDUM 

To: Hamblen County Board of Commissioners 

From: Hamblen County Planning Commission, Danny Young, Director 

Re: 2012 International Code Adoption 

Date: December 1, 2014 

 

The Hamblen County Planning Commission recommends the adoption of the following codes: 

 

- 2012 International Building Code -    2012 International Fuel Gas Code 

- 2012 International Fire Code  -    2012 International Property Maintenance Code 

- 2012 International Plumbing Code -    2012 International Energy Conservation Code 

- 2012 International Mechanical Code -    2012 North Carolina State Bld. Code, Vol. 1-C 

           with 2004 Revisions 

 

 Together with Exhibits A – D as listed below: 

- Exhibit A – Supplemental Information (Amendments) 

- Exhibit B – International Code Descriptions with Appendices adopted 

- Exhibit C - Required Inspections and Permit Requirements 

- Exhibit D – Fee Schedules 

Amendments to the codes are listed individually in exhibit A.  In general they establish 

appropriate appeals boards; delete electrical and septic/sewer requirements as they fall under the 

rules and regulations of the State; local storm water requirements are authorized; and code 

violations and penalties are set forth.  Specific amendments to the individual codes are also listed 

in this exhibit.  Specific appendices being adopted for each of the code are listed in exhibit B 

along with the overall code descriptions.  The required inspections and permit requirements are 

listed in exhibit C.  Finally, the fee charts for permits and administrative charges are listed in 

exhibit D, parts 1-4.  

These codes are founded on principles intended to establish provisions consistent with the scope 

of being adequately protective of the public health, safety and welfare of the citizens of Hamblen 

County.  Your consideration and local adoption of the attached Resolution will allow the County 

to continue to provide an up-to-date set of codes addressing the design and construction of the 

built environment of this jurisdiction. 

 

Attachment – Proposed Resolution for adoption 

52 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



RESOLUTION TO ADOPT VARIOUS INTERNATIONAL AND ACCESSIBILITY CODES 

 

 WHEREAS, on October 21, 1999, the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners adopted the 

1997 edition of various Standard Building Codes as published by the Southern Building Code Congress 

International, Inc.; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners adopted an Amended Resolution on 

December 16, 1999 to include various appendices to the previously adopted building codes; and 

 

 WHEREAS, on December 20, 2001, Hamblen County Board of Commissioners restated its 

previous resolution by clarifying under which of the adopted codes inspections would be performed; and 

 

 WHEREAS, on October 21, 2004, the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners adopted the 

1991 North Carolina State Handicapped Accessibility Code; and 

 

 WHEREAS, on October 18, 2007 of the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners updated its 

building codes by adopting the 2006 Edition of  various  codes as  published by the International Code 

Council as well as the 2002 North Carolina State Handicapped Code, Volume 1-C with 2004 Revisions; 

and 

 

 WHEREAS, it is now the desire of the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners to once again 

update its building codes by adopting the 2012 Edition of the hereinafter enumerated codes,  including the 

administrative provisions contained therein, as  published by the International Code Council as well as 

readopting of the 2002 North Carolina State Handicapped Code, Volume1-C with 2004 Revisions; and 

 

 WHEREAS, a copy of this Resolution has been published in a newspaper having general 

circulation in Hamblen County as required by Tennessee Code Annotated § 5-20-102 (c);  

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners, 

meeting in regular session on December 18, 2014, hereby adopts the following 2012 Editions of the 

International Code Council’s Codes and readopts the North Carolina State Building Code, Volume 1-C 

with 2004 Revisions, which have been filed of record in the County Clerk’s Office for more than ninety 

(90) days preceding this Resolution and in lieu of the current Hamblen County Building Codes: 

 

-  2012 International Building Code  -  2012 International Fuel Gas Code  

-  2012 International Residential Code  -  2012 International Property Maintenance Code 

-  2012 International Fire Code   -  2012 International Energy Conservation Code 

-  2012 International Plumbing Code  -  2002 North Carolina State Building Code,Volume 1-C 

-  2012 International Mechanical Code     with 2004 Revisions  

 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners hereby 

further adopts the attached: Exhibit A-Supplemental Information (Amendments); Exhibit B-International 

Code Descriptions (including Appendices to be adopted); Exhibit C-Required Inspections and Permit 

53 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Requirements; and Exhibit D-Fee Schedules, which Exhibits are hereby  incorporated herein by reference 

in their entirety. 

 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Resolution shall become effective on January 1, 2015, 

following the adoption of this Resolution by the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners. 

 

  

 

 WHEREFORE, it was moved by _______________________________ and seconded by 

 

___________________________ that this Resolution be adopted. 

 

 

  Voting Aye:   _______ 

 

  Voting Nay:   _______ 

 

  Pass:  _______ 

 

 The Chair declared the Resolution adopted this _____ day of ______________, 2014. 

 

 

      Hamblen County Board of Commissioners 

      

      By:  ________________________________ 

              Stancil Ford, Chairman 

 

 

 

APPROVED:     ATTEST: 

 

 

________________________________  __________________________________ 

Bill Brittian     Linda Wilder 

Hamblen County Mayor    Hamblen County Clerk 

 

 

54 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



HAMBLEN COUNTY, 

TENNESSEE 

 

 

 

 

INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL (ICC) 
 

2012 
 

CODE EDITION 

 

 

 

 

 

 

RECOMMENDATION 

FOR ADOPTION 

 

DECEMBER, 2014 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Recommendation Made by: 

Hamblen County Planning Commission 

 

 

 

 

Daniel M. Young, Director 

55 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

 

 

TABLE OF CONTENTS 

  

Section I.  Background Information 

  

Section II.  Resolution to Adopt International and Accessibility  

  Codes 

  

Section III.  Exhibit A – Supplemental Information to the International 

    Code Text (Amendments) 

  

Section IV. Exhibit B - International Code Descriptions (Appendices 

    Adopted) 

  

Section V.  Exhibit C - Required Inspections to Comply with ICC 

    Technical Codes and Permit Requirements 

  

Section VI. Exhibit D - Fee Schedules 
  Part 1.  Building Permit Fee Chart (including associated Admin. 

    Charges) 

  Part 2.  Plumbing Permit Fee Schedule 

  Part 3.  Gas Permit Fee Schedule 

  Part 4.  Mechanical Permit Fee Schedule 

Contact Information: 

Hamblen County Planning Commission 

511 W. 2nd North Street, Morristown, TN. 37814 

Phone: 423-581-1373     Fax: 423-587-7089     Stormwater Hotline: 423-585-4077 

Office Hours:  Monday-Friday, 8:00am  -  4:30pm 

56 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

Section 

I 

57 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Background Information 

  

 
Hamblen County recognizes the need for a modern, up-to-date, set of codes that addresses the design 

and construction of the built environment within its jurisdiction.  The International Code Council 

(ICC), 2012 Edition, set of International Codes (I-Codes) fulfills this need.  This includes I-Codes in 

the following areas:  Building, Residential, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fuel Gas, Fire, Energy 

Conservation, and Property Maintenance Codes.  In addition, the State of Tennessee has adopted the 

2002 North Carolina State Building Code, Volume 1-C with 2004 Revisions (Handicap Code), which 

the County also intends to re-adopt. 

  

These codes are founded on principals intended to establish provisions consistent with the scope of 

being adequately protective of the public health, safety and welfare of the citizens of Hamblen County.  

Further, these codes do not unnecessarily increase construction costs nor do they restrict the use of, or 

give preferential treatment to new materials, products or methods of construction. 

  

By taking this action of adopting an updated set of the aforementioned codes, the following benefit 

may be realized.  Both current and future citizens of Hamblen County will be assured that their 

investment, and improvements made thereto in a home or commercial business, is being put into a 

quality-built structure. 

 

Also, according to the last Insurance Service Office (ISO) analysis of the county’s building code 

adoption and enforcement program our Building Code Effectiveness Grading Schedule (BCEGS) 

Classification is a Class 99 for 1&2 family residential property and a Class 5 for commercial and 

industrial property.  This ISO rating classification utilizing the Building Code Effectiveness Grading 

program is an advisory insurance underwriting information and rating tool. 

 

Hamblen County first adopted the 1997 edition of the Southern (Standard) Building Codes in October 

1999. Subsequently codes enforcement and inspections began county-wide in January 2000.  The 

State requires all local jurisdictions that have adopted local codes to enforcement of the minimum 

“Statewide Building Construction Safety Standards”.  Effective December 2008, the state upgraded 

the state standards by adopting the 2006 edition of the International Building Code, among others. 

 

Then in June 2010, the State adopted the 2009 edition of the International Residential Code and began 

requiring permitting and inspections of all 1&2 family dwellings and townhouses in this state, effective 

October 1, 2010.  Beginning on October 1, 2011 plumbing and mechanical permitting and inspections 

were then included in these state mandatory requirements.  Therefore, unless a local jurisdiction has 

been exempted from these state wide code requirements, a state deputy inspector will be conducting 

inspections of the work if the local jurisdiction does not implement and enforce such a program of their 

own. 

  

It is the county’s intention that the following I-Codes will be enforced by way of permits and 

inspections: Building, Residential, Plumbing, Mechanical and Fuel Gas.  The remaining adopted 

codes will be used as required by law, and as referenced in the aforementioned codes, but will not 

require a separate permit to be issued. 

58 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Section 

II 

59 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



RESOLUTION TO ADOPT VARIOUS INTERNATIONAL AND ACCESSIBILITY CODES 

 

WHEREAS, on October 21, 1999, the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners adopted the 1997 

edition of various Standard Building Codes as published by the Southern Building Code Congress 

International, Inc.; and 

 

WHEREAS, the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners adopted an Amended Resolution on 

December 16, 1999 to include various appendices to the previously adopted building codes; and 

 

WHEREAS, on December 20, 2001, Hamblen County Board of Commissioners restated its 

previous resolution by clarifying under which of the adopted codes inspections would be performed; and 

 

WHEREAS, on October 21, 2004, the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners adopted the 1991 

North Carolina State Handicapped Accessibility Code; and 

 

WHEREAS, on October 18, 2007 of the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners updated its building 

codes by adopting the 2006 Edition of  various  codes as  published by the International Code Council 

as well as the 2002 North Carolina State Handicapped Code, Volume 1-C with 2004 Revisions; and 

 

WHEREAS, it is now the desire of the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners to once again update 

its building codes by adopting the 2012 Edition of the hereinafter enumerated codes,  including the 

administrative provisions contained therein, as  published by the International Code Council as well as 

readopting of the 2002 North Carolina State Handicapped Code, Volume1-C with 2004 Revisions; and 
 

WHEREAS, a copy of this Resolution has been published in a newspaper having general circulation in 

Hamblen County as required by Tennessee Code Annotated § 5-20-102 (c);  

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners, 

meeting in regular session on December 18, 2014, hereby adopts the following 2012 Editions of the 

International Code Council’s Codes and readopts the North Carolina State Building Code, Volume 1-C 

with 2004 Revisions, which have been filed of record in the County Clerk’s Office for more than ninety 

(90) days preceding this Resolution and in lieu of the current Hamblen County Building Codes: 

 
-  2012 International Building Code  -  2012 International Fuel Gas Code  

-  2012 International Residential Code  -  2012 International Property Maintenance Code 

-  2012 International Fire Code   -  2012 International Energy Conservation Code 

-  2012 International Plumbing Code  -  2002 North Carolina State Building Code,Volume1-C 

-  2012 International Mechanical Code     with 2004 Revisions  

 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners hereby 

further adopts the attached: Exhibit A-Supplemental Information (Amendments); Exhibit B-International 

Code Descriptions (including Appendices to be adopted); Exhibit C-Required Inspections and Permit 

Requirements; and Exhibit D-Fee Schedules, which Exhibits are hereby  incorporated herein by 

reference in their entirety. 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Resolution shall become effective on January 1, 2015, 

following the adoption of this Resolution by the Hamblen County Board of Commissioners. 

 

  

60 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

WHEREFORE, it was moved by _______________________________ and seconded by 

 

___________________________ that this Resolution be adopted. 

 

 

  Voting Aye:   _______ 

 

  Voting Nay:   _______ 

 

  Pass:  _______ 

 

 The Chair declared the Resolution adopted this _____ day of ______________, 2014. 

 

 

      Hamblen County Board of Commissioners 

      

      By:  ________________________________ 

              Stancil Ford, Chairman 

 

 

 

APPROVED:     ATTEST: 

 

 

________________________________  __________________________________ 

Bill Brittian     Linda Wilder 

Hamblen County Mayor    Hamblen County Clerk 

 

61 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Section 

III 

62 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Exhibit A 
 

Supplemental Information to the International Code Text 
(Amendments) 

 

 

Where referenced in the International Codes, the following provisions shall apply: 

 

 Board of Appeals shall mean the Hamblen County Construction Board of Adjustments and 

Appeals, except; where flood plain construction management and property maintenance issues are 

involved, in those cases the Hamblen County Board of Zoning Appeals shall act upon such 

issues. 

 

 All Electrical requirements referenced shall be deleted and the following inserted; Compliance 

with the  current Rules and Regulations of the State of Tennessee as found in Chapter 

0780-02-01 (Electrical Installations), as well as those of the appropriate local authority having 

jurisdiction, shall be considered compliance with all sections of the codes which reference 

electrical provisions. 

 

 All Septic and Sewer requirements referenced shall be deleted and the following inserted; 

Compliance with the current Rules and Regulations of the State of Tennessee as found in Chapter 

0400-48-01 (Subsurface Sewage Disposal Systems), as well as those of the appropriate local 

authority having jurisdiction, shall be considered compliance with all sections of the codes which 

reference septic system or sanitary sewer provisions. 

 

 All Stormwater requirements referenced shall be deleted and the following inserted; 

Compliance with the current  rules and regulations of the Hamblen County Zoning, Subdivision 

and Storm Water Control Resolutions, as well as those of the appropriate state authority having 

jurisdiction, shall be considered compliance with all sections of the codes which reference storm 

water provisions. 

  

 Storm Water Permit and  Inspection requirements:   It shall be the responsibility of the 

owner or his authorized agent, or both, to ensure that a storm water permit is obtained and that all 

storm water run-off protective measures are properly installed and maintained in an adequate 

condition at all times prior to, and during, the construction process.  At a minimum, a permit 

must be obtained and inspections shall be performed; 1) prior to any earth moving or land 

disturbance activities taking place, 2) once all protective measures are initially installed, 3) after 

each significant rainfall event and every 72 hours when a State CGP is involved, and 4) after the 

site is properly stabilized but prior to the protective measures being removed. 

 

These minimum inspections shall either be performed by Hamblen County authorized inspectors 

at the request of the owner or his authorized agent or by a state-authorized certified inspector 

when a State CGP is involved.  In cases where a state-authorized certified inspector conducts the 

inspections, the documented inspection records shall be kept on the site and made readily 

available to county, state or federal officials upon request.  For additional information and/or 

requirements concerning storm water permitting and inspections, see Hamblen County’s Zoning, 

Subdivision, and Storm Water Control Resolutions or the TN Department of Environment and 

Conservation (TDEC) regulations, as applicable. 

 

63 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 Code Violations – Penalties:  In accordance with Tennessee Code Annotated (TCA) 5-20-105; 

any person, firm, corporation or agent who violates a provision of any code or fails to comply 

therewith, or with any of the provisions thereof, or violates a detailed statement or plan submitted 

and approved thereunder, commits a Class C Misdemeanor.  Each such person, firm, corporation 

or agent commits a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof during which any 

violation of any provisions of a code are committed or continued.  In addition, TCA 5-1-121 

provides that a monetary penalty of up to five hundred dollars ($500) may be imposed for each 

violation of a rule or regulation that the county legislative body is authorized to adopt.  

Furthermore, in addition to any fines and/or penalties which may be levied hereunder a person, 

firm, corporation or agent found to be in violation may also be required to pay any reasonable 

attorney fees and all related court costs. 

 

 Specific Amendments – See the following sections: 

 

 

 International Building Code (IBC) 

 

 -  Section 101.1 insert “Hamblen County” where indicated. 

 -  Section 109 insert “See appropriate fee schedule in Exhibit D” under the word FEES.  

 -  Section 1612.3 insert “Hamblen County” and “July 3, 2006” where indicated. 

 -  Section 1809.1 delete the sentence after the word General and insert the following sentences: 

 

 Unless permitted otherwise by the building official, the minimum size  of concrete footings for 

 all occupancies located  within this jurisdiction shall be 24 inches wide by 12 inches thick, with  

 at least two (2) number 4 longitudinal  reinforcement bars placed parallel in the bottom  

 one-third of  the footer depth. Where a nominal  four inch floor slab is  cast monolithically with 

 a perimeter footing, in such  cases, the footer section(s) shall be at least a minimum of eight 

 inches  below the bottom of the floor slab with one (1) number 5 reinforcement bar being 

 permitted to be located at either the top or bottom one-third of the footer section(s).  Additional 

 reinforcement bars may be required in the floor  slab, or footer section(s), based on site specific 

 conditions (i.e., longitudinal bar placement at twenty-four inch, center to center, turned down and 

 tied to the perimeter footing reinforcement). 

  

 International Residential Code (IRC) 

 

 -  Section R101.1 insert “Hamblen County” where indicated. 

 -  Section R105.2 under the sub-heading Buildings:  1. Replace the number 200 with 120. 

            2. Delete all words after fences. 

            4. Delete all words after tanks. 

           10. Delete exemption entirely. 

  

 -  Section R105.2 under the sub-heading Electrical: Delete entirely. 

 -  Section R106.1 at the end of the first paragraph before the exception, insert “All construction     

    documents, includingthe site plan, for all buildings over 5,000 square feet in area and for    

    any building with three or more attached dwellingunits shall be prepared and sealed by a     

    registered design professional licensed by the State of Tennessee.”  

 -  Section R108 insert “See appropriate fee schedule in Exhibit D” under the word FEES. 

  

 

 

64 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 -  Table R301.2 (1) shall read as follows:   
 

        CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA         

      
          SUBJECT TO 
DAMAGE FROM: 

 
            

Ground Wind Seismic       Winter Ice Barrier   Air Mean 

Snow Speed‏ Design   
Frost 
Line   Design Underlayment Flood Freezing Annual 

Load (mph) Category Weathering Depth Termite Temp Required Hazards Index Temp 

10 90 C Severe 12 Mod-Heav 18°f No 7-3-2006 500 57° 

 

- Section R302.5.1delete “equipped with a self-closing device” and insert a period after the 

word “doors”. 

- Section R303.4 add the word “(Optional)” in the title and add the words “when required by 

the building official” to the end of the section. 

- Section R313 add the words “(Optional, see TCA 68-120-101 (a) (8) for details)” after the 

word “Systems”. 

 -   Section R313.1 delete the second sentence and insert “When installed in townhouses, the  

     following shall apply.” 

 -   Section R313.2 delete the second sentence and insert “When installed in one- and two family      

     dwellings, the following shall apply.” 

 -   Section R403.1.1 insert  “Unless permitted otherwise by the building official, the minimum     

     size of concrete footings for all occupancies located within this jurisdiction shall be 24 inches 

     wide by 12 inches thick, with at least two (2) number 4 longitudinal reinforcement bars   

     placed parallel in the bottom one-third of the footer depth.  Otherwise the”, between the  

     words, ” “size”. and “Minimum” in the title of the subsection). 

 -   Figure 403.1 (1) insert foot notes that read: 1. Where a nominal four inch floor slab is cast   

     monolithically with a perimeter footing, the footer section shall extend at least a minimum of  

     eight inches below the bottom of the floor slab with one (1) number 5 reinforcement bar  

     being located at either the top or bottom one-third of the footer section. Additional  bars may 

     be required in the floor slab, or footer section, based on site specific conditions (i.e.,      

     longitudinal bar placement at twenty-four inch, center to center, turned down and tied to the  

     perimeter footing reinforcement). 2.  The bottom of all foundations shall extend a minimum  

     of 12 inches below finished grade. 

 -  Section R501.3 insert the words (See TCA 68-120-101 (h) for applicability after 1/1/16.) to the 

    end of Exception 2.  

 -  Section R502.11.4 delete the words (to the building official and approved) and replace them   

    with the words (for review when required by the building official) in the first sentence. 

 -  Section R602.6 delete the second occurrence of the word (no).  

 -  Section R802.10.1 delete the words (to the building official and approved) and replace them   

    with the words (for review when required by the building official) in the first sentence.   

 -  Table N1102.1.1 (R402.1.1) in the row for climate zone 4 except Marine, change R- 49 to  

    R-38, and change the Wood Frame Wall R-Value from 20 or 13+5 to 13, and change the Mass 

    Wall R-Value from 8/13 to 5/10. 

 -  Table N1102.1.3 (R402.1.3) in the row for climate zone 4 except Marine, change Ceiling  

    U-Factor from 0.026 to0.30, and change the Wood Frame Wall U-Factor from 0.057 to 0.o82,  

    and change the Mass Wall U-Factor from 0.098 to 0.141. 

 -  Section N1102.2.6 (R402.2.6) after the first occurrence of the work “of” insert Table     

    N1102.1.1 or. 

 -  Section N1102.4.1.1 (R402.4.1.1) after the word “Installation” in the section title add the   

    words “and visual inspection option”, and after the word “construction” add the words “and be 

    field verified.” 

65 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 -  Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) after the word “Testing” in the section title add the word   

    “(optional) and before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building official,” 

 -  Section N1103.1.1 (R403.1.1) after the word “thermostat” in the section title add the word  

    “(optional) and before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building official and,” 

 -  Section N1103.2.2 (R403.2.2) before the words “Duct tightness” insert “Where required by the 

    building official,” 

 -  Section N1103.4.1 (R403.4.1) add the sentence “All circulating service hot water piping shall   

    be insulated to at least R-2.” after the title section. 

 -  Section N1103.4.2 (R403.4.2) delete the word “Prescriptive” and insert the word ”Optional” in 

    the section title, and insert the words “Where required by the building official,” before the first 

    sentence. 

 -  Section N1103.5 (R403.5) delete the word “Mandatory” and replace with the word “Optional” 

    in the section title.  Delete “The building shall be provided with ventilation that meets” and    

    insert the words “Buildings provided with ventilation shall meet” 

 -  Section N1103.9 (R403.9) delete the word “Mandatory” and replace with the word “Optional” 

    in the section title and before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building     

     official,” 

 -  Section N1104 delete the word “Mandatory” and insert the word “Optional” in the section title 

 -  Section N1104.1 (R404.1) delete the word “Mandatory” and replace with the word “Optional” 

    in the section title and before the first sentence insert “Where required by the building    

    official,” 

 -  Section 2503.5.1 deleted the words, “for piping systems other than plastic” in the first sentence 

    after the word “or” and insert the words, “except when specifically allowed by the code  

    official,” after the word “ air” in the first sentence. 

 -  Section P2603.5.1 insert the number (18) in two places where indicated. 

 -  Section P2904 add “WHEN REQUIRED” before the section title and, “SHALL MEET THE   

    FOLLOWING REQUIREMENTS” after the section title. 

 -  Delete Part VIII – Electrical, including chapters 34 through 43.  
 

 International Plumbing Code (IPC) 

  

 -  Section 101.1 insert Hamblen County where indicated. 

 -  Section 106.6.2 insert “See appropriate fee schedule in Exhibit D” where indicated. 

 -  Section 106.6.3 delete both items #2 and #3 in this subsection. 

 -  Section 108.4 insert  (Class C Misdemeanor)  ($50.00) and  (30 days) where indicated. 

 -  Section 108.5 delete the word” fine” and insert the word “penalty” in the last sentence and   

    insert ($50.00) and ($500.00) where indicated. 

 -  Section 305.4.1 insert (18") in both places where indicated. 

 -  Section 312.3 insert the words, “except when specifically allowed by the code official.”, at the 

    end of  the first sentence. 

 -  Section 903.1 insert (6") where indicated. 
 

 International Mechanical Code IMC 

 

 -  Section 101.1 insert Hamblen County where indicated. 

 -  Section 106.5.2 insert “See appropriate fee schedule in Exhibit D” where indicated. 

 -  Section 106.5.3 delete both items #2 and #3 in this subsection. 

 -  Section 108.4 insert (Class C Misdemeanor)  ($50.00) and  (30 days) where indicated. 

 -  Section 108.5 delete the word” fine” and insert the word “penalty” in the last sentence and   

    insert ($50.00) and ($500.00) where indicated. 
   

66 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC) 

 

 -  Section 101.1 insert Hamblen County where indicated. 

 -  Section 106.6.2 insert “See appropriate fee schedule in Exhibit D” where indicated.  

 -  Section 106.6.3 delete both items #2 and #3 in this subsection. 

 -  Section 108.4 insert (Class C Misdemeanor) ($50.00) (30 days) where indicated. 

 -  Section 108.5 delete the word” fine” and insert the word “penalty” in the last sentence and    

    insert ($50.00) and ($500.00) where indicated. 

 

 International Fire Code (IFC) 

 

 -  Section 101.1 insert Hamblen County where indicated. 

 -  Section 109.4 insert  (Class C Misdemeanor)  ($50.00) and  (30 days) where indicated. 

 -  Section 111.4 delete the word” fine” and insert the word “penalty” in the last sentence and    

    Insert ($50.00) and ($500.00) where indicated. 
 

 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC)  
 

 -  Section 101.1: insert (Hamblen County) 
 

 International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC) 

 

 -  Section 101.1 insert (Hamblen County) where indicated. 

 -  Section 101.2 add the word “related” in place of the words “all existing” in the first sentence.   

    Delete all the words between the word “standards” and the first”;”.   

 -  Section 103.5 delete this entire subsection. 

 -  Section 301.3 insert the words “When required by the code official” at the beginning of the  

    sentence and delete the words “or vacant land” from the sentence.  

 -  Section 302.4 insert (12") where indicated. 

 -  Section 304.14 delete “During the period from [DATE] to [DATE],” in the first sentence. 

 -  Section 305 delete the entire section. 

 -  Section 307.1 delete the words “and interior” after the word “exterior” and the words  “a   

    stair” after the word “of” in the first sentence. 

 -  Chapters 4, 5, 6 and 7 are deleted entirely. 
 

 2002 NCSBC, Volume 1-C, with 2004 Revisions 

  

 -  As Is 

67 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Section 

IV 

68 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Exhibit B 

 
International Code Descriptions 

(Appendices Adopted) 

 

 

International Building Code (IBC) -  Applies to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, 

replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition of 

every building or structure or any appurtenance connected or attached to such building or structure. 

 

The purpose of this code is to establish the minimum requirements to safeguard the public health, safety 

and general welfare through structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate 

light and ventilation, energy conservation, and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards 

attributed to the built environment and to provide safety to fire fighters and energy responders during 

emergency operations. 

 

Exception: Detached one and two family dwellings and multiple single family dwellings (townhouses) 

not more than 3 stories above grade plane in height with a separate means of egress and their accessory 

structures shall comply with the International Residential Code (IRC). 

 

 Appendices to be adopted: 

  A- Employee Qualifications 

  C- Agricultural Buildings 

  F- Rodent-proofing 

  G- Flood-Resistant Construction 

 

 

International Residential Code (IRC) -  Applies to the construction, alteration, movement, 

enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of 

detached one and two-family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories above-grade in height 

with a separate means of egress and their accessory structures. 

 

The purpose of this code is to provide the minimum requirements to safeguard the public health, safety 

and general welfare through affordability, structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, 

sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy conservation, and safety to life and property from fire 

and other hazards attributed to the built environment. 

 

 Appendices to be adopted: 

  A- Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping 

  B- Sizing of Venting Systems 

  C- Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and Direct Vent Venting Systems 

  F – Radon Control Methods 

  G- Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs 

  J- Existing Buildings and Structures 

  N- Venting Methods 

 

69 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



International Plumbing Code (IPC) -  Applies to the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, 

relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing systems within the jurisdiction.  It 

also regulates non-flammable medical gas, inhalation anesthetic, vacuum piping, non-medical oxygen 

systems and sanitary and condensate vacuum collection systems.  The installation of fuel gas distribution 

piping and equipment, fuel-gas-fired water heaters and water heater venting systems shall be regulated by 

the International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC). 

 

The purpose of the code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property, and 

public welfare by regulating and controlling of the design, construction, installation, quality of materials, 

location, operation and maintenance or use of plumbing equipment systems. 

 

Exception:  Detached one and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) 

not more than 3 stories high with separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply 

with the International Residential Code (IRC). 

 

 Appendices to be adopted: 

  B- Rates of Rainfall 

  D- Degree Day & Design Temperatures 

  E- Sizing of Water Piping Systems 

  F- Structural Safety 

 

 

International Mechanical Code (IMC)  -  Applies to the design, installation, maintenance, alteration 

and inspection of mechanical systems that are permanently installed and utilized to provide control of 

environmental conditions and related processes within buildings.  It also regulates those mechanical 

systems, components, equipment and appliances specifically addressed herein. The installation of fuel gas 

distribution piping and equipment, appliances and appliance venting systems shall be regulated by the 

International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC). 

 

The purpose of this code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property and 

public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation, quality of materials, 

location, operation and maintenance or use of mechanical systems. 

 

Exception: Detached one and two family dwellings and multiple single family dwellings (townhouses) 

not more than 3 stories high with separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply 

with the International Residential Code (IRC). 

 

 Appendices to be adopted: 

  A- Combustive Air Openings 

 

 

International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC) -  Applies to the installation of fuel gas piping systems, fuel gas 

utilization equipment, gaseous hydrogen systems and related accessories. 

 

The purpose of the code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, health, property, and 

public welfare by regulating and controlling of the design, construction, installation, quality of materials, 

location, operation and maintenance or use of fuel gas systems. 

 

Exception: Detached one and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) 

not more than three stories high and separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply 

with the International Residential Code (IRC). 

70 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

 

 Appendices to be adopted: 

  A- Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping 

  B- Sizing of Venting Systems 

  C- Exit Terminals 

 

 

International Fire Code (IFC)  - Establishes regulations affecting or relating to structures, processes, 

premises and safeguards regarding: 1) The hazard of fire and explosion arising from the storage, handling 

or use of structures, materials or devices; 2) Conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the 

occupancy of structures or premises; 3) Fire hazards in the structure or on the premise from occupancy or 

operation; 4) Matters related to the construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire 

suppression or alarm systems. 

 

The purpose of this code is to establish the minimum requirements consistent with nationally recognized 

good practice for providing a reasonable level of life safety and property protection from the hazards of 

fire, explosion or dangerous conditions in new and existing buildings, structures and premises and to 

provide safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency operations. 

 

 Appendices to be adopted: 

  B- Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings 

  C- Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution 

  D- Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

 

 

International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) -  Applies to residential & commercial buildings and 

regulates the design and construction of building for the effective use of energy.  It is intended to provide 

flexibility to permit the use of innovative approaches and techniques to achieve the effective use of 

energy.  It is not intended to abridge safety, health and/or environmental requirements contained in other 

applicable codes or ordinances. 

 

 No Appendices to be adopted: 
 

 

International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC) - Applies to all existing residential and 

non-residential structures and all existing premises and constitute minimum requirements and standards 

for premises, structures, equipment and facilities; the responsibility of owners, operators and occupants; 

the occupancy of existing structures and premises, and for administration, enforcement, and penalties. 

 

The purpose of the code shall be construed to secure its expressed intent, which is to ensure public health, 

safety and welfare insofar as they are affected by the continued occupancy and maintenance of structures 

and premises.  Existing structures and premises that do not comply with these provisions shall be altered 

or repaired to provide a minimum level of health and safety as required herein. 

 

 No Appendices to be adopted: 

   

 

71 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Section 

V 

72 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Exhibit C 
 

Required Inspections to Comply with the ICC Technical Codes 

 

 

Building Code  (See Section 109.3 for a complete listing.) 

 

Residential Code (See Section R109.1 for a complete listing)  At a minimum, they will include: 

 1.  Foundation inspection:  To be made after trenches are excavated and any reinforcement    

     bars or rods are in place and forms erected, if applicable, and prior to concrete being poured. 

 2.  Frame inspection:  To be made after the roof, all framing members, fire blocking and  

     bracing is in place; and after all electrical wiring, plumbing pipes, drains, chimneys, ducts and 

     vents are complete. 

 3.  Final inspection:  To be made after the building is completed and ready for occupancy. 

 

Plumbing Code 
 1.  Underground inspection:  To be made after trenches or ditches are excavated and bedded,   

     piping installed, and before any backfill is put in place. 

 2.  Rough-in inspection:  To be made after the roof, framing, fire blocking, fire stopping, draft  

     stopping and bracing is in place and all sanitary, storm and water distribution piping is   

     completely roughed in, and prior to the installation of wall or ceiling membranes.  This  

     inspection shall include pressure tests. 

 3.  Final inspection:  To be made after the building is complete, all plumbing fixtures are in     

     place and properly connected, and the structure is ready for occupancy.   

  

Mechanical Code 
 1.  Underground inspection:  To be made after trenches or ditches are excavated, underground 

     duct and fuel piping installed, and before any backfill is put in place. 

 2.  Rough-in inspection:  To be made after the roof, framing, fire blocking and bracing is in    

     place and all ducting, and other concealed components are complete, and prior to the      

     installation of wall or ceiling membranes. 

 3.  Final inspection:  To be made after the building is complete, the mechanical system is in   

     place and properly connected, and the structure is ready for occupancy. 

 

Gas Code 
 1.  Rough piping inspection:  To be made after all new piping authorized by a permit has been 

     installed, and before any such piping has been covered or concealed or any fixtures or gas   

     appliances have been connected.  This inspection may include a pressure test. 

 2.  Final piping inspection:  To be made after all piping authorized by the permit has been   

     installed and after all portions which are to be concealed by plastering or otherwise have been 

     so concealed, and before any fixtures or gas appliances have been connected. This inspection   

     shall include a pressure test. 

 3.  Final inspection:  To be made on all new gas work authorized by the permit and such 

     portions of existing systems as may be affected by new work or any changes, to insure   

     compliance with all the requirements of the code and to assure that the installation and   

     construction of the gas system is in accordancewith the approved permit. 

 

Septic/Sewer and Electrical  
 1.  To comply with state laws concerning permitting and inspection requirements: Contact  

     the local sewer system and electrical service provider(s) and/or TDEC, as may be appropriate, 

     for details. 

73 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Technical Code Permit Requirements 

 

Permits in General: 

When applying for a permit, an applicant shall first complete the application form as prescribed by the 

Planning Commission Office, submitting both a site plan and a floor plan of the proposed work.  In 

addition, an applicant must present any license or permit required by state law or local resolution and 

have proof of septic or sewer availability. Once the application is processed (normally 24 hours) the 

applicant shall then present payment in an acceptable form and may then pick-up the permit. 

 

All permits, once issued, are non-transferable.  All work done under such permit shall be subject to 

regular inspection requirements and fees as well as other applicable laws and regulations.  The permit 

shall become void if the authorized work is not commenced within 180 days after its issuance, or if the 

permitted work is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days thereafter.  The building official is 

authorized to grant one or more extensions of time, not exceeding 180 days each, provided a written 

request is submitted by the permit holder and justifiable cause is demonstrated.  

 

Every permit shall expire two (2) years from the date of issue or upon the issuance of the certificate of 

occupancy (C.O.) unless:1) the inspector determines that substantial progress has been made in the work 

authorized by the permit; and 2) the permit holder is granted an extension of time, as described above, 

after submitting a written request to the building official.   

 

Contractor's Responsibilities: 

It shall be the duty of every contractor who enters into contracts for the installation or repair of building, 

plumbing, mechanical or gas systems for which a permit is required to comply with adopted state and 

local rules and regulations concerning licensing.  No building permit shall be issued until a copy of either 

a certificate of insurance or a workers’ compensation policy is provided as evidence of the existence of 

workers’ compensation insurance.  This insurance requirement does not apply to persons not required by 

TCA 50-6-405 and 406 to obtain workers’ compensation coverage 

 

Property Owner’s Permit: 

The insurance requirement mentioned above does not apply to any person who performs, or supervises; 

work on such person’s own property in such person’s own county of residence, provided such person 

shall present or sign an affidavit which attests to their exemption from the requirement.  Pursuant to 

68-6-103 an individual may obtain only one (1) property owner’s permit within a twenty four (24) month 

period. 

 

When Required: 

Any owner, authorized agent, or contractor who desires to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, 

demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or structure; or to erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair, 

remove, convert or replace any gas, mechanical or plumbing system; the installation of which is regulated 

by the technical codes, or cause any such work to be done, shall first make contact with the code official 

and obtain the required permit prior to initiation of the work. 

 

The following allowed exception from the permit requirement of a code shall not be deemed to grant 

authorization for any work to be done in violation of the provisions of the code or any other laws or 

regulations of this state or the local jurisdiction. 

 

Ordinary Minor Repairs: 

Ordinary minor household repairs may be made with the approval of the building official without a 

permit, provided that such repairs shall not violate any of the provisions of the technical codes. 

 

74 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Fees: 

A permit shall not be issued until the required fees prescribed have been paid, and an amendment to a 

permit shall not be released until the additional fee (if any) has been paid. 

 

 

 

Work Commencing Before Permit Issuance: 

Any person who commences any work on a building, plumbing, mechanical or gas system before 

obtaining the necessary permit(s) shall be subject to a 100 percent penalty of the usual permit fee in 

addition to the required permit fee(s). 

 

Fee Refunds: 

The code official shall authorize a refund of the full amount any fee(s) paid hereunder which were either 

erroneously paid or collected.  The code official shall not be authorized to issue a refund of any fee(s) 

paid unless a written application is filed, by the original permittee, no later than 30 days after the date of 

the payment. 

 

75 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Section 

VI 

76 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Exhibit D - Part 1 

             Building Permit Fee Chart and Admin. Charges   
  

 Activity / Type of Structure     Charge 
  

New Const.Commercial/Industrial ……………………  .55¢ / sq. ft.under roof up to 10,000 sq. ft. 

(includes churches)     (Plus) 25¢ / sq. ft. over 10,000 sq. ft. 

New Const. Residential with Basement …………..…. 55¢ / sq. ft. of total conditioned space 

(includes unfinished basement and/or basement garage) 

New Const. Residential without Basement ………….... 50¢ / sq. ft. of total conditioned space 

(includes crawl space or slab) 

Additions to Existing Structures ……………………… (See above New Const. charges, as applicable) 

Remodeling of Existing Structures …………………... 10¢ / sq. ft. ($25 min. charge) 

(includes interior space only with  no structural support alterations allowed, otherwise see below) 

Renovations of Existing Structures………….……..... 25¢ / sq. ft. 

Stick-built or Prefab. Storage Buildings/Garages….  25¢ / sq. ft. (<120 sq. ft. only setbacks apply) 

Decks and Covered Porches with or w/out sidewalls.. 25¢ / sq. ft.($25.00 min.) 

Free-Standing Metal Carports or similar structures.... $25.00 each 

   

Double Wide Mobile Homes Placement Permit ……….…….  $350.00 each 

(includes decks if const. when placed or within 60 days of placement) 

Single Wide Mobile Home Placement Permit …………….  $100.00 each 

(includes decks if const. when placed or within 60 days of placement) 

Modular Homes (includes foundation inspection)……….…..  25¢ / sq. ft. plus S/W permit 

  

Demolition of R/C/I structures (0 to 100,000 cubic ft.) ………  $50.00  

(over 100,000 cu. ft.) …………………………………..   50¢ per additional 1,000 cubic feet 

Moving Fee …………………………………………………..  $100.00 

(after receiving approval by proper authority) 

Miscellaneous Fee ……………………………………………  $50.00 

(activity/structure not otherwise listed, includes swimming pools >36”deep) 

  

Cell Tower Construction ……………………………………...  $2,500 / tower site 

(includes non-refundable application review fee and associated bldg. permit, if approved.) 

Co-location or swap out of antennae on existing tower ………  $50.00 / array or level 

Upgrade to tower ground level facilities …………….……….  $50.00 per occurrence 

Drop & Swap of support structure (rebuild/height extended)...  $500.00 per occurrence 

  

Signs - Minimum Fee…………………………………………  $10.00 / sign face minimum 

Billboards (off premises) ……………………………………..  55¢ / sq. ft. of sign face per side 

Advertisement (on premises, including billboards) ….……….  55¢ / sq. ft. of sign face per side 

Subdivision (Residential, Commercial or Industrial) ………...  $25.00 per sign face minimum 

  

Stormwater Management Permit……………………………...  $100.00 / lot disturbed 

(may be issued with or without a building permit) 

Land Disturbance/Earth Moving/Site Development Permit  $100.00 / lot developed 

(This fee applies to all major subdivision development plats when they are approved.) 

Note that Major Subdivision Developments (i.e., 3 or more lots), or any project involving one acre or 

more of land disturbance, requires a local Drainage Plan submission and may require a State CGP, if 

applicable. 

77 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



  

Administrative Charges: 

Approval of Subdivision Plat ………………….. ……………. $150.00 / plat 

Variance Request …………………………………………….. $50.00 / request 

Use-On-Review Determination ……………………………… $50.00 / request 

Re-zoning Request ……………………………………………. $75.00 / request 

Other Permits and Fees …………………………(See Plumbing, Mechanical and Gas Fee Charts) 

 

78 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Exhibit D - Part 2 

Plumbing Permit Fee Schedule 

  
Permit Issuance 

  

 For issuing each permit -------------------------------------------------------- $10.00 

 For issuing each supplemental permit  ----------------------------------- $ 5.00 

  

  

Unit Fee Schedule 
  

 For each plumbing fixture or trap -------------------------------------------- $ 5.00 

 (includes water and drainage pipe) 

 For each building water main ------------------------------------------------- $10.00 

 (includes installation, alteration or repair) 

 For each building drain/sewer  -----------------------------------------------$10.00 

 For each water heater ---------------------------------------------------------- $ 5.00 

 For each floor drain  ----------------------------------------------------------- $ 5.00 

 For each waste pre-treatment interceptor (outside) ------------------------ $10.00 

 For each waste pre-treatment interceptor (inside) ------------------------- $ 5.00 

 For repair or alteration of drainage or vent --------------------------------- $ 5.00 

 For atmospheric-type vacuum breakers (1 to 5) --------------------------- $ 5.00 

 (over 5  -  $1.00 each) 

 For reduced pressure-type backflow preventer --------------------------- $10.00 

 For each private sewage disposal system ----------------------------------- N/A 

 For each rainwater system (per drain) --------------------------------------- N/A 

 For each lawn sprinkler system on any one meter ------------------------- N/A 

  

Other Inspections and Fees 
  

 Inspections outside of normal business hours  --------------------------- $20.00 

 Re-inspection fee, after 2nd failure to pass ----------------------------------- $25.00 

 Inspection for which no fee is specifically indicated ------------------ $10.00 

 Additional fee required by changes, additions or revisions 

 to approve permit ---------------------------------------------------------------- $10.00 

  

 Notes: 
   -  If any person commences any work before obtaining the necessary permit and/or inspection, 

          the fee shall be doubled. 

  

   -  N/A means "not applicable at this time". 

79 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Exhibit D - Part 3 

Gas Permit Fee Schedule 

  
Permit Issuance 

 
 For issuing each permit ---------------------------------------------------------- $10.00 

 For issuing each supplemental permit ----------------------------------------- $  5.00 

  

  

  

Unit Fee Schedule 

  
 For each consumer's gas piping at one location ------------------------------ $10.00 

 (including 1 to 4 gas outlets) 

 For each additional gas outlets ------------------------------------------------- $  2.50 

 For first appliance hook-up to piping system -------------------------------- $  5.00 

 For each additional hook-up ---------------------------------------------------- $  2.50 

 For first venting system installation ------------------------------------------- $  5.00 

 For each additional venting system -------------------------------------------- $  2.50 

  

  

  

Other Inspections and Fees 
  

 Inspection outside of normal business hours --------------------------------- $20.00 

 Re-inspection fee, after 2nd failure to pass ----------------------------------- $25.00 

 Inspection for which no fee is specifically indicated ------------------------ $10.00 

 Additional fee required by changes, additions or revisions 

 to approved permit --------------------------------------------------------------- $10.00 

  

  

 Notes: 
 -  If any person commences any work before obtaining the necessary permit and/or inspection, 

        fees shall be doubled. 

80 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



Exhibit D - Part 4 

Mechanical Permit Fee Schedule 

  

  
Permit Issuance 

 

 For issuing each permit --------------------------------------------------------- $10.00 

 For issuing each supplemental permit ---------------------------------------- $ 5 .00 

  

  

  

Unit Fee Schedule 

 
 For each heating, ventilating, duct work, air conditioning and/or refrigeration system: 

  

 (1 to 2 ton capacity) -------------------------------------------------------- $ 5.00 each 

 (2 to 5 ton capacity) ----------------------------------------------------------- $ 5.00 additional 

 (> 5 ton capacity) -------------------------------------------------------------- $ 5.00 additional 

  

 For repairs, alterations and additions to an existing system -------------- $10.00 

  

 For boiler installations (State inspected - see State of TN for requirements) 

  

  

  

Other Inspections and Fees 

  
 Inspection outside of normal business hours --------------------------------- $20.00 

 Re-inspection fee, after 2nd failure to pass ----------------------------------- $25.00 

 Inspection for which no fee is specifically indicated ------------------------ $10.00 

 Additional fee required by changes, additions or revisions 

 to approved permit --------------------------------------------------------------- $10.00 

  

  

 Notes: 
 -  If any person commences any work before obtaining the necessary permit and/or inspection, 

         fees shall be doubled. 

  

 

81 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 Hamblen County Government 

BUILDING AND GROUNDS COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, December 8, 2014 

Immediately Following Adjournment of Public Services Committee 

Hamblen County Health Department, Conference Room 

 

 

AGENDA 

 

 

1. Call to Order – Chairman Howard Shipley 

 

2. Visitors Wishing to Address the Committee – Chairman Howard Shipley 

 

3. Old Business – Chairman Howard Shipley 

a. Flag Pole Project – Commissioner Tim Goins 

 

4. New Business - Chairman Howard Shipley 

a. None 

 

5. Adjournment – Chairman Howard Shipley 

 

Howard Shipley 

Chairman 

 

Larry Carter 

Vice-Chairman 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Rick Eldridge 

Member 

 

Tim Goins 

Member 

 

Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

Member 

 

Johnny Walker 

Member 

 

Dana Wampler 

Member 

 

Taylor Ward 

Member 

 

 

B U I L D I N G  A N D  

G R O U N D S  

C O M M I T T E E  

82 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

83 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 Hamblen County Government 

PERSONNEL COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, December 8, 2014 

Immediately Following Adjournment of Buildings and Grounds Committee 

Hamblen County Health Department, Conference Room 

 

 

AGENDA 

 

 

1. Call to Order – Chairman Hubert Davis 

 

2. Visitors Wishing to Address the Committee – Chairman Hubert Davis 

 

3. Old Business – Chairman Hubert Davis 

a. None 

 

4. New Business - Chairman Hubert Davis 

a. Drug Testing  

 

5. Adjournment – Chairman Hubert Davis 

 

Hubert Davis 

Chairman 

 

Joe Huntsman 

Vice-Chairman 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Larry Carter 

Member 

 

Randy DeBord 

Member 

 

Rick Eldrigde 

Member 

 

Tim Goins 

Member 

 

Herbert Harville 

Member 

 

Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

Member 

 

Howard Shipley 

Member 

 

John Smyth 

Member 

 

Johnny Walker 

Member 

 

Dana Wampler 

Member 

 

Taylor Ward 

Member 

 

P E R S O N N E L  

C O M M I T T E E  

84 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



U. S. Citizenship and Immigration Services, a bureau of the Department of Homeland 
Security, has publications to assist the employer in Gompleting Form 1-9. 

Drug and Alcohol Testing. Employers have become increasingly interested in testing 
employees for drug and alcohol use. Drug testing by government employers is 
permissible only under certain circumstances because the testing constitutes a "search" 
under the Fourth and Fourteenth Amendments to the United States Constitution. Any 
testing must meet the constitutional standard of reasonableness, and testing must be 
conducted in accordance with the due process and equal protection clauses of the 
constitution. As a general rule, only employees who are in safety-sensitive positions 
may be tested. Local governments can be held liable for monetary damages when an 
employee's constitutional rights have been violated. Before considering any testing 
program, the employer should consult the sections on drug testing contained in the 
eTAS publication entitled Legal Aspects of Personnel Management. 

Federal regulations require testing of employees who are required by law to have 
commercial driver licenses (CDLs). Employees who must be tested are those who drive 
(1) vehicles over 26,000 pounds gross vehicle weight rating (GVWR) , (2) trailers over 
10,000 pounds GywR if the gross combination weight rating is more than 26,000 
pounds, (3)-vehicles designed to carry 16 or m<?re passengers including the driver, and 
(4) any size vehicle used to transport hazardous materials (required to have a placard). 
These employees have been determined by the federal government to be in safety­
sensitive positions. Since January 1, 1996, all county departments where COL drivers 
are employed have been required to have a testing program in place for these drivers. 
The testing program must comply with detailed federal guidelines contained in the 
federal regulations. 

Finally, Workers' compensation laws and regulations have created a voluntary program 
of drug testing that can result in reduced premiums for Workers' compensation 
insurance and denial of Workers' compensation benefits to impaired workers. T.C.A. 
§ 50-9-101 et seq. This program is optional - employers are not required to participate. 
The program must be carefully tailored to the needs of the government employer so that 
the employees' constitutional rights are not infringed. 

It is strongly re,commended that counties wishing to implement a drug and alcohol 
testing program, whether under DOT regulations or under the Workers' compensation 
law, contract with a reputable and experienced company to handle all aspects of the 
testing program on the county's behalf. It is imperative that such a program not be 
implemented without the advice of the county attorney or another attorney hired to 
advise the county on this issue. 

Workers' Compensation. The Workers' compensation I~ws are a non-fault based 
statutory scheme for compensating employees who suffer injuries in the scope of their 
employment. T.C.A. § 50-6-101 et seq. In private industry, on-the-job injuries are 
governed by these laws, but counties are not covered by the Workers' compensation 
laws unless they choose to be covered. T.C.A. § 50-6-106. A county's decision to come 
under these laws becomes effective 30 days after the county files written notice of 

253 

85 Return to Committee 
Cover Page

cdibb
Highlight



County Technical Assistance Service 
Published on e-Li (http://ctas-eILctas.tennessee.edu) 
Home> Personnel> Drug and Alcohol Testing:;' Governmental Employee Drug Testing - The ConstitutionallssLies ' , 

Governmental Employee Drug Testing - The ConstitutionallssUes 
I 

Governmental Employee Drug Testing - The Constitutional Issues 

Reference Number: CTAS-1076 

, ,Tennessee Code Annotated 

Reference lNumber: CTAS-1076 

Drug testing of employees in the private sector has becomerquite comm.0('. Local gov~rnrT),ents alsq have become 

interested in testing of employees to detect drug and/or alcohol use. Unlike employers in. the prjvat\3 ,s~ctor,. ;however, 
: i ~. .' , . "! ' .' 

governmental employers are limited by constitutional considerations. It is wel.1 settled that drug tes~ing . py gov~rnment 
, ," < •. ) ',"<;' !. 

employers constitutes a "search" under the Fourth Amendment to the l!nited States C.o~stitution. Pr6ba~le caus~ 

and a warrant are generally required for government searches, although th,e Supreme Court has carved out 

exceptions)11 Even in those instances where testing is p~rmitted under the FourthA~en.d~ent, the due process 
, . ' .. '. " , " 

. ~Iause and the equal protection clause of the Constitution prohibit certain practices ?l,nd procecjures in. cqnnection with 
• .' . . ,~ 1 

the testing of employees. Local government employers can be held liable for monetary, dar:n:ag~s r'hyn an employee's 

constitutional rights havebe,en violated as a result of dr~g testing.[2] ' " , ,<: i . '.. . 

The first cases decided by the 'United States Supreme Court involving ~~ploye~ dr~g testing were Nation~1 T~~asury 
Empioyees Union v. Von Raab, 109 S.Ct. 1384 (1989), an'd Skinner v: R~ii~ay Labor E.;ecufives' Associ~tidn, 109 

, • I ' ,:; ~ • • ) • • 

S.Ct. 1402 (1989). The Court adopted a balancing test to determine whether drug testing of government employees is 

constitutionally permissible, finding that the governmental interestsin testing must be b~la!lced against the, 

em~loyee's liberty and privacy interests to determine wheth~r a warrant, prpbable cau~eor individualized suspicion is 

required in the particular context. Unless there are "special needs beyond t,he norm.~1 ne~d for law enforcement" 

which are sufficiently compelling to overcome the individual's privacy interests ~ a wa~rant and prol:>able cause are 

required . The Supreme Court found testing without a warrant permissible in three instanyes: (1) customs officers 

involved in front-line drug interdiction; (2) customs officers who carry firearms; and (3) train operators where a . ,'" 

documented problem with drug/alcohol related accidents existed in the industry. The Court found that employees in 

these positions performed duties "fraught with such risks of injury to others that even a' momentary lapse of attention 

can have disastrous consequences." Since these decisions, lower courts have struggled with the limits of the Court's 

rulings. Some courts have interpreted the rulings more broadly than others. 

The Supreme Court again addressed the issue in 1997 in Chandler v. Millerf.31 when the Court was asked to decide 

the constitutionality of a Georgia statute requiring candidates for state office to pass a drug test. The Court found that 

candidates for public office are not "safety sensitive" and cannot constitutionally be subjected to drug testing . In 

reaching this conclusion the Court reviewed the applicable law, noting that to be reasonable under the Fourth 

Amendment a search ordinarily must be based on individualized suspicion, but exceptions are sometimes warranted 

based on concerns other than law enforcement and in these special circumstances, courts must make a context­

specific inquiry to determine whether individual privacy interests are outweighed by a sufficiently important 

governmental interest. In this case the Court found that Georgia showed no "special need" for the testing, so even 
86 Return to Committee 

Cover Page



though the method was found to have been relatively non-intrusive the testing was nonetheless unconstitutional. The 

Court held that "the preferred special need for drug testing must be sUbstantial- ,important enough to override the 

individual's acknowledged privacy interest, sufficiently vital to' suppress the Fourth AfTlendme,nt's normal requirement 

of individualized suspicion.,,[41 The state argued that the testing was justified because unlawful drug use is 

incompatible with public office and calls into question the official's judgment and integrity, it jeopardizes the qischarge 

of public functions including anU-drwg law enforcement, and it undermines public confidence and trust in elected 

officials. However, the Court found that the state showed no "concrete danger demanding departure from the Fourth 

Amendment's main rule."[5] The Court found that although a demonstrated problem with drug abuse is not necessary 

in all cases to the validity of a testing program, it does provide evidence of a need for the testing and in this case no 

such justification was present. The Court further noted that Georgia "offered no reason why ordinary law enforcement 

methods would not suffice to apprehend such addicted individuals, should they appear in the limelight of a public 

stage."[6) The Court pointed out.differences between this case and, th~ circumstances present in the' Von·Raab case, 

including the fact that in Von Raab there was a demonstrated problem with bribery by drug smugglers and the 

employees worked in a situation where it was not feasible to subject them and their work product to "the kind of day­

to-day scrutiny that is the norm in more traditional office environments.',[7) 

The first question in the analysis is whether there is a valid public interest to be protected by drug testing. A 

generalized 'desire to eliminate drug and/or alcohol use among employees is nbt enough!; the employer must have a 

"compelling interest" to be protected. In Chandler, the Court made'it clear that much more'than a desire to shOw'a 

symbolic commitment to the struggle against drug abuse is required to sUbstantiate' drug testing program.l8) In the 

Von Raab case, which allowed testing of certain officers in the' u.s. customs Service, the Supreme Court fOlirid that 

the federal government has a compelling interest in ensuring that customs officers who are directly involved in front:­

line drug interdiction and thbse who carry firearms are not drug impaired.[9) In the 'Skinner case, ~the Court fOLind that 

in view of the d'emonstrated problem with drug and alcohol use among railroad operators and 'the grave harm caused 

by train accidents involvin'g impaited Operators, the government has a' 'compellin'g 'interest in ansuring th'at train 

operators are not impaired by drugs or alcohol. The Court found that these classes of employeesperforni duties 

"fraught with such risks of injury to others that even a momentary lapse of attention can have disastrous , . .' . , I, .., 

consequences. '; In Skinner, the Court also noted that employe~s with routineaGc~ss to 'dangero'us nuclear facilities 
al~o perform duties fraught with such risks. ' , ', '. .' ' 

If a local government employer wants to implement some form of drug andjoraiboholtesting, it must first be' 

determined who is to be tested and Why it is necessary 't6 test each ' ~artrcular group. Is there a documented drug or 

alcohol problem in the particular Workforce? Is the group pelforming duties that are "fraught with such risks of injury to 

others that even a momentary lapse of attention can have disastrous consequences" simtlar:tb train operators, 

nuclear power plant operators, and customs agents who are directly involved in drug interdiction and who carry 

firearms? A compelling interest must be identified, other than the' need for law enforcement; to justify the testin'g. 

Once it has been determined that there exist sufficiently compelling "special needs" to ensure that a particular group 

of employees are not using drugs or alcohol, it should be determined whether there are other, less intrusive means to 

accomplish the objective. For example, would proper supervision of employees identify a drug or alcohol problem, or 

is the risk involved so great that more extreme measures must be taken?[10) Is supervision of the particular group 

impractical, as in long-haul truck drivers who perform their jobs alone for long periods of time without supervision? 

If testing is determined to be the only effective means under the circumstances, the appropriate testing program must 

be considered. Several options or combinations of testing methods are generally employed: (1) job applicants, (2) 

employees who are reasonably suspected to be impaired as a result of drug or alcohol use, (3) all employees on a 

random or periodic (including annual physicals and return-to-work testing) basis, and/or (4) employees involved in an 

accident or other incident related to public safety. The testing program must be reasonably related to the special 

governmental needs to be served, with all of the circumstances being considered , 
87 Return to Committee 

Cover Page



With regard to job applicants, courts have routinely held that government employers may require successful 

completion of a drug screening as a condition of employmenfin Or' promotion'to a safety sensitive position.l11 ] In 

addition, it has been held that drug screening of an applicant is less intrusive where the applicant is already required 

to undergo a physical examination requiring a blood or' urine sample'.[12] 'However; wholesale testihg of applicants for 

government employment without regard to the nature of the position has nOt'been upheld in any court in this 

jurisdiction, arid the Tennessee Attorney General 'is 'of the opinion that the'practice is Linconstitutional:[13] A federal 

district court struck down as unconstitutional a Georgia statute' requiring routine testing df all applicants fdf state 

employmenU14] Accordingly, routine pre-employment testing should be used only for applicants who will ocCupy 

sensitive positions. 'Applicants should be informed in advance of the testing requirement, and testing should be 

limited to those who have been tentatively selected for the position.l15] 

The United States Supreme Court has never approved any kind of testing for employees in non-sensitive positions, 

including suspicion-based testing.l16]How8ver, reasonable suspicion testing is widely believed to be justified for all 

government employees, and the Tennessee Attorney General appears to be of th'e opinion that such testing is 

permissible regardless of the sensitive nature of the position)17] Uhtil the issue ha;s been settled, it may be' unwise to 

test any employees in non-sensitive positions. Even for employees in sensitive positions, the inquiry does not end ' 

here. There must be a reasonable, individualized suspicion of on-duty drug use or ihlpaifrhent.[1B1Uncorroborated tips 

and "hunches" are not enough. In addition, courts have routinely held that suspicion lofoff-dtJty drug or alcohol use 

will not justify testing unless it results in on-the-job impairment. For example, a district court in Tennessee found that 

an employer's concerns that off-duty drug use could ,impair performance on-site were legitimate for employees at the 

Oak Ridge nuclear weapons plant where the potential harm to s'oCiety that could be caused by an impaired employee 

was "irretrievable" and "catastrophic."[191A statement quoted by the Tennessee Attorney General is instructive on this 

point: "The state, as employer, simply has no business trying' to ferret'out private' ml"sconduct that does not affecfj6b 
perforrriance.,,[20) " Ii ' ' " , 

" , '. 
Random testing is the most problematic of all the testing methods; and :courts have been 'reluctant to allow random 

testing except in situations where the potential for harm to the' public as a result of'employee impairment is 

partiCularly compelling. Courts have been, reluctant to subjeCt the,average public employee who hasgiveh no 

indication of. wrongdoing to a procedure so offensive as being compelled to produce bodily fluids for examination by 

his or her employer. Random testing has been upheld by the Supreme Court for customs agents involved in front-line 

drug interdiction and those who carry firearms, and customs agents who are entrusted with truly sensitive classified 
, , , . , . ~ " I : . . ' : . 

information affecting national security. Federal district courts in Tennessee and the Sixth Circuit Court of Appeals 

have allowed random testing of firefighters, policemen who carrY firearms and workers at nuclear weapons plants. 

[21]Other courts have allowed random testing only in positions that have been determined to involve compelling public 

safety concerns. The courts are by no means uniform in their determin'ation of what constitutes a sufficient public 

safety 'concern to justify random testing, and the law is rapidly devel~ping as new cases are decided and old ones 

overturned. The Tennessee Attorney General has issued an opinion that random testing is unconstitutional unless the 

position involves public safety.[22) Although the Tennessee Supreme Court has not made any determination on this 

issue, the Massachusetts Supreme Court has determined that random drug testing, even of police and firefighters, is 

unconstitutional under the Massachusetts constitution. [23) 

Post-accident testing was allowed by the Supreme Court in Skinner for railroad employees who were directly involved 

in an accident. The testing must be limited to those employees who actually could have caused the accident. Lower 

courts, including the Sixth Circuit, have allowed post-accident testing of mass transit drivers.[2t11Written policies and 

procedures must be in effect and the information disseminated to the employees. 

Even where testing is justified at its inception, it also must be reasonable in its implementation. The testing must be 

pursuant to established policy and not subject to the discretion of officers in the field. "An essential purpose of a 

warrant requirement is to protect privacy interests by assuring citizens subject to a search or seizure that such 88 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



89 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



90 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



91 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 Hamblen County Government 

CALENDAR & RULES COMMITTEE 

 

Monday, December 8, 2014 

Immediately Following Adjournment of Personnel Committee 

Hamblen County Health Department, Conference Room 

 

 

AGENDA 

 

 

1. Call to Order – Chairman John Smyth 

 

2. Review of Regular Calendar Items – Chairman John Smyth 

 

3. Review of Consent Calendar Items – Chairman John Smyth 

 

4. Adjournment – Chairman John Smyth 

 

John Smyth 

Chairman 

 

Dana Wampler 

Vice-Chairman 

 

Stancil Ford 

Ex-Officio 

 

Louis “Doe” Jarvis 

Member 

 

Herbert Harville 

Member 

 

Howard Shipley 

Member 

 

C A L E N D A R  &  R U L E S  

C O M M I T T E E  

92 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

 

   HAMBLEN COUNTY LEGISLATIVE BODY 
 

 

Regularly Scheduled Monthly Meeting 

Thursday, December 18, 2014 

5 p.m. 
 

 

 

 

Open Meeting - Sheriff Esco Jarnagin 

 

Call to Order – Chairman Stancil Ford 

 

Prayer – Reverend Danny Hensley, Panther Springs United Methodist  

 

Pledge of Allegiance – Commissioner John Smyth 

 

Roll Call - County Clerk Linda Wilder 

 

Recognition of Visitors – Chairman Stancil Ford 

 

 

Prepared under the direction of: 

Chairman Stancil Ford 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

93 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Order # Vote Item 

1  Recognition (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
 

 
a. Employee Recognition 
b. Proclamation - Morristown West High Cross Country Lady Trojans 

 

2  Resolutions (Chairman Stancil Ford)  
  a. None 

 

3  Appointments and Nominations (Chairman Stancil Ford)  
  a. None 

 

4  Public Official Bonds (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
  a. None 

 

5  Calendar and Rules Committee Report (Chairman John Smyth)  
  Vote 

Vote 
a. Approval of Consent Calendar Items 
b. Approval of Regular Calendar Items 

 

6  Approval of Consent Calendar (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
 Vote a. Consent Calendar 

 

7  Finance Committee (Chairman Louis “Doe” Jarvis) 
 Vote a. Approval of Monthly Checks 
 Vote b. Community Development Block Grant Resolution 
 Vote c. TDOT- School Safety Grant Resolution 
 Vote d. Bids -  Detachable In-Car Police Video Camera Bid 
  e. Budget Amendments 
 Vote 1. Assessor of Property – Reclassification $5,000 
 Vote 2. Hamblen County Board of Education – Increase $157,641.51 

8  Public Services Committee (Chairman Herbert Harville) 
 Vote a. Resolution to Adopt 2012 International and Accessibility Codes 

 

9  Announcements /Informational Items / Upcoming Meeting Dates (Chairman Stancil Ford) 
 

 
a. January 12, 2014 – Committee Meetings at 11:30 a.m. - Health Dept. Conference Room 
b. January 22, 2014 – County Commission Meeting: at 5 p.m. - Third Floor Large Courtroom 

 

10  Adjournment (Chairman Stancil Ford) 

REGULAR CALENDAR 
       Thursday,  December  18,  2014  

              H a m b l e n  C o u n t y  L e g i s l a t i v e  B o d y  

REGULAR CALENDAR –December 18, 2014 

94 Return to Committee 
Cover Page



 

 

CONSENT CALENDAR                H a m b l e n  C o u n t y  L e g i s l a t i v e  B o d y               

Order # Item Placed From 

1  Approval of the Previous Month’s Minutes 
a. Hamblen County Commission Meeting – October 16, 2014 

 

Chairman Stancil Ford 

2  Approval of Notaries County Clerk Linda Wilder 

3  Operating Summaries – November 2014 Finance Committee 

4 Planning Commission Building Permit Report – November 2014  Finance Committee 

5 County Attorney Invoices – November 2014 Finance Committee 

6 Coroner’s Report – November 2014 Finance Committee 

8 Hamblen County Board of Education  - First Quarter Expenditure Report 2014 -2015 
 

Finance Committee 

9 Comcast – Notification of Price Changes Finance Committee 

 10 Helen Ross McNabb 2014 in Review  Finance Committee 

Thursday, December 18, 2014 

  

95 Return to Committee 
Cover Page




